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Trails Across the Community 
 
Since 1995, the City and County have con-
structed nearly 20 miles of off-street network 
and 5 miles of on-street bike lanes.  The original 
Kiwanis Trail, extending from Mary Street to 
Yellowstone Road was completed in 1997.  In 
1999 an additional two miles were added ex-
tending the trail from Yellowstone Road to 
Coulson Park.  The last 2.6 mile segment was 
completed in 2002 and extends from Coulson 
Park to Mystic Park along the Yellowstone 
River.  A new on-street bike route segment 
which would connect the river bike path with 
downtown was also striped along South 25th 
Street   The final connection between the bike 
lanes on South 25th St. to the river trail is still 
incomplete due to the inability to acquire a corri-
dor through private land holdings.  If completed, 
the project would provide access from the river 
trail to downtown.  Private and public funding is 
now being sought to provide a pedestrian/bicycle 
bridge connection spanning the railroad tracks at 
South 25th St. to connect Montana Avenue with 
Minnesota Avenue.  Plans are also underway to 
construct a bike/pedestrian underpass in the Al-
kali Creek corridor under Main Street which 
would link to the MetraPark portion of the 
Dutcher Trail. 
 
Several other areas of the Billings community 
have also realized trail connections in the past 
five years including a 10 foot wide trail running 
through Descro Park, crossing Central with a 
refuge island and an additional trail section 
through Stewart Park to Monad.  Plans are now 
in the works for the continuation of the trail 
through Lampman Strip Park, connecting to the 
trail along Famous Dave’s Restaurant with an at-
grade crossing of King Ave, W. and continua-
tion along Pierce Flooring which will link to the 
east to connect to the Midland Trail by 24th St. 
W.  Eventually this trail will also extend to the 
west and link with the trail section that has been 
built through the TransTech Center.  Another 
segment of trail, the Big Ditch Trail has also 
been built in line with Colton Blvd. from 38th 
St. W. to 46th St. W. with links to side streets 
and Rimrock West Park and makes use of the 
pedestrian underpass at Shiloh Road. 

In 2005, the first 2 miles of trail were built on 
the west side of Swords Park.  Funding is cur-
rently being sought to construct the second 
phase of the Swords Park Trail which will link 
to an underpass at Airport Road and Alkali 
Creek Road during the Airport Road reconstruc-
tion project. 
 
Complete Streets 
 
It has become a policy of the City of Billings 
Public Works Department that new and rehabili-
tated arterial and collector streets should include 
multi-use paths.  Street projects that have in-
cluded multi-use trails are Zimmerman Trail, 
Alkali Creek Road and So. Billings Boulevard.  
Several streets have been striped with bike lanes 
and funding from CTEP is in place to stripe an 
additional 5-6 miles of bike lanes in various ar-
eas of the City that are part of the Heritage Plan 
where the road width will accommodate both on
-street parking and a bike lane.  The City of Bill-
ings currently has 5 miles of streets with bike 
lanes and an additional 51 miles identified in the 
Heritage Trail Plan.  Several road projects are 
already in the works at various stages of devel-
opment that will include multi-use trails along  
one side of the project, which will help make 
additional connections within the community.  
These projects include King Ave. W., Aronson 
Road, Rimrock Road, and Shiloh Road. 

The new portion of Zimmerman Trail from Poly 
Dr. to Broadwater Ave. was constructed in 
2006 as a “complete street” with a multi-use 
path on one side, boulevards, and a sidewalk 
on the other side. 



Page  164 

Chapter 4.7: Transportation 

The City of Billings has also realized several 
trail projects that have been built as part of sub-
divisions development.  These include trails in 
King’s Green, Rehberg Ranch, Copper Ridge, 
Falcon Ridge and J&E subdivisions.  The Alter-
nate Modes Coordinator reviews all subdivision 
plats for their inclusion of the Heritage Trail 
Plan.  State law requires that all major subdivi-
sion preserve 11% of their property for parkland 
dedication or cash in lieu.  If the Heritage Plan 
has identified a trail corridor within that subdivi-
sion, the developer can use that land preserved 
as part of their parkland dedication.  The GIS 
system is now mapping those undeveloped corri-
dors for future trail use. 
 
Measuring Trail Usage 
 
As trail projects have been constructed, it has 
been an important aspect to determine the 
amount and type of usage the trails have re-
ceived.  Every other year, the Planning Depart-
ment conducts a physical count on the trails on a 
weekday and again on a weekend day with vol-
unteers counting the total uses by walkers, run-
ners, bikers, skaters, etc., and if users are wear-
ing helmets when biking or skating.  This infor-
mation demonstrates which trails receive the 
highest volume and since beginning these counts 
in 2003, there has seen a 32% increase in the 
overall use on the trails.  In the fall of 2007, the 
Alternate Modes Coordinator Office started us-
ing an infrared scanner to also track usage on the 
trails and this information will be compiled and 
linked to a trail count map for quick reference.   
 
There are also many opportunities in the Greater 
Billings area to hike or mountain bike on natural 
surface trails.  Over 40 miles of these natural 
trails exist along the Yellowstone Riverfront, 
along the rimrocks, and within the immediate 
bounds of the City.  In close proximity to the 
community, are an additional 60 plus miles of 
natural trails on publicly owned recreational 
land. 
 
Funding Options and Opportunities 
 
Funding is a continual struggle for infrastructure 
projects.  Most of the funding for trail projects 

has been realized through the Community Trans-
portation Enhancement Program (CTEP), which 
provides approximately $600,000 per year to 
Yellowstone County.  In recent years, funding 
has been used to support trail projects and the 
missing sidewalk program, which are sidewalks 
within the immediate vicinity of public schools.  
During the early years of the CTEP program, 
funds were utilized to refurbish the old Depot 
Building which is used for community events 
and large gatherings. 
 
Billings and Yellowstone County have effec-
tively used additional funds through the Trans-
portation legislation from the Recreational Trails 
Program (RTP), the Land and Water Conserva-
tion Fund (LWCF), Safe Routes to School 
(SRTS) the Community Mitigation Air Quality 
Fund (CMAQ), and the Transportation, Commu-
nity, and System Preservation Program (TCSP).  
Most of these federal programs require a local 
match of 13% to 50%.  As noted previously, in 
November 1999, the City of Billings taxpayers 
passed a General Obligation (GO) Bond for 
$599,000 for local matching funds for the trail 
program.  This was one of the first bond issues 
ever passed in the City.  The GO Bond is almost 
exhausted and has helped establish numerous 
projects in the Billings community by providing 
the match for millions of dollars in federal 
funds.   
 
Another large contributor for local match has 
been the BikeNet organization.  It reorganized in 
1999 and became a 501 (c) (3) organization in 
2002.  BikeNet’s vision is for improving the 
quality of life by making the Billings community 
an inviting place for bicycles and pedestrians.  
The vision includes transportation options, rec-
reation enhancements, and improved access to 
resources by all populations, as well as, conser-
vation of community resources.  In 2000, 
BikeNet held its first fundraising effort with the 
Ales for Trails event which has now become one 
of the most enjoyed annual fundraising events in 
the City of Billings.  BikeNet has sought spon-
sorship for the event from individuals and busi-
nesses and, to date has raised well over $100,000 
which has been exclusively used for matching 
funds for the various bike/pedestrian projects. 
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In addition to the money raised through fund-
raising efforts, trail and bikeway projects have 
been successful in garnering matching funds 
through other grants from organizations and 
foundations, such as, Bikes Belong Coalition, 
the Mildred & Homer Scott Foundation, Mon-
tana Community Foundation, Fannie Mae Foun-
dation, U.S. Bank, and St. Vincent’s Healthcare.  
To date, we have built nearly 20 miles of hard 
surface multi-use trails which include bridges 
and underpasses, and expended approximately 
$5.5 million.  Our non-motorized plan identifies 
another 74 miles of paved multi-use trails. 
 
Multi-Use Trails Priority projects recommended 
in the Heritage Trail Plan include: 
• Alkali Creek Trail 
• BBWA Heights Trail 
• BBWA Northwest Trail 
• BBWA West End Trail 
• Big Ditch Trail 
• Blue Creek Trail 
• Downtown RR Trail 
• Riverfront Trail 
• Senators Trail 
• Zimmerman Trail 
 
On-Street Primary Bikeways Priority projects 
recommended in the Heritage Trail Plan include: 
• Poly Drive 
• Colton Blvd. 
• Lewis Avenue 
• Monad Road 
• 17th Street West 
• Parkhill Drive 
• 20th/19th Street West 
• North 28th Street 
• North 30th Street 
• Lake Elmo Drive 
• 8th Street West 
• 9th Ave. North 
• 1st Street West 
• N.19th/N.18th St. 
• South 28th Street 
• South 34th Street 
• 2nd Ave. South 
• Mary Street 
• Duck Creek Road 
 

More information regarding funding and design 
of bicycle and pedestrian projects is provided in 
the 2004 Heritage Trail Plan and updates, as 
well as in the City of Billings Design Standards 
Trails and Bikeways Manual. 
 
Public Transportation 
 
MET Transit Service provides scheduled bus 
service within the City of Billings.  MET oper-
ates a fleet of 11, 35-foot RTS buses, six 35-foot 
Nova Buses, two 30-foot low floor Eldorado 
buses, and six 35-foot Gillig buses.   There are 
18 fixed routes offered Monday through Friday 
and nine fixed routes on Saturday.  The primary 
transfer areas are located downtown and Stewart 
Park. 

 
Transportation System Management Plan (TSM) 
Projects that would improve operation of the 
street and highway network and reduce travel 
delays, referred to as Transportation System 
Management strategies, were identified in the 
2005 Transportation Plan.  These strategies are 
low-cost opportunities to better manage and op-
erate the existing transportation infrastructure in 
the near-term.  The plan lists TSM projects not 
yet implemented from the 1990 Transportation 
Plan and those developed as part of the 2000 
Transportation Plan. The Plan identified $13 
million of improvements over the next 10 years.  
The projects include signalization of intersec-
tion, reconstruction of intersection, some street 
widening, turn lane improvements, sidewalk in-
stallation and implementation of the City Signal 
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Table 2:  2006 Design Standards by Functional Class for County Road Development 

Street Type Right- of-Way Road 
Width 

Lane 
Width 

Parking 
Width 

Turn lane 
width 

Median 
Width 

Pathway 
Width 

Principal Arterial               

6 lanes w/center  
turn-lane 

120’ 92’* 12’/14’** --- 14’ --- 5’ 

4 lanes 
w/center turn-lane 

120’ 92’* 12’/14’** --- 14’ --- 5’ 

Minor Arterial               
4 lanes w/median 100’ 68’* 12’ --- --- 14’ 5’ 

2 lanes w/median 100’ 52’* 12’ --- --- 14’ 5’ 

Commercial Collector               

2 lane 80’ 44’* 14’ 8’ --- --- 5’ 
2 lanes w/center  
turn lane 

80’ 42’* 14’ --- 14’ --- 5’ 

Residential Collector               

2 lane 70’ 40’* 12’ 8’ --- --- 5’ 
2 lanes w/center  
turn lane 

80’ 50’* 12’ 8’ 14’ --- 5’ 

Residential Local  
Access 

56’/60’*** 28’ 12 n/s --- --- 5’ 

Cul-de-Sac  
100-1000 feet 

56’/60’*** 28’ 12 n/s --- --- 5’ 

Cul-de-Sac 
<100 feet 

40’ 24’ 
min. 

10 n/s --- --- --- 

*  Widths to be provided if warranted by a Traffic Accessibility Study. 
**   Interior lane(s) is 12 feet and the outside lane is 14 feet.  
*** 56 feet is required for subdivisions within the zoning jurisdiction.  60 feet is required for  
 subdivisions outside the zoning jurisdiction. 
n/s   No width is specified. 

Table 1:  2006 Design Standards by Functional Class for City Street Development 

Street Type Right- 
of-Way 

B-B Curb 
Width 

Lane 
Width 

Parking 
Width 

Turn lane 
width 

Median 
Width 

Boulevard 
Width 

Sidewalk 

Width 

Principal Arte-
rial 

  130’ 64’-86’* 11’-12’** --- 14’ --- 10’ 5’/10’ *** 

Minor Arterial 100’ 42’-66’ * 12’ --- --- 14’ 10’ 5’ 
Collector 74’ 53’-39’ 11’ 8’ 14’ --- 5’ 5’ 
Commercial 
Local Access 

70’ 44’-45’ 13.5’ 8’ 14’ --- 5’ 5’ 

Residential 
Local Access 

56’ 34’ min. n/s n/s --- --- 5’ 5’ 

Cul-de-Sac 
100-600 feet 

56’ 34’ min. n/s n/s --- --- 5’ 5’ 

Cul-de-Sac 
<100 feet 

40’ 29’ min. n/s n/s --- --- --- --- 

* A traffic study is required to determine final width 
** Interior lane(s) is 11’ and the outside lane is 12’ 
*** Sidewalk is 5’ on one side and 10’ on the other side 
n/s  No specific width is specified 
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Priority Program.   A variety of funding sources 
could be used to implement the TSMs, including 
federal and state programs, local fuel tax funds 
and private developers.  A complete list of the 
TSM Plan Project Elements, along with costs 
and potential funding sources, is provided in the 
Billings Urban Area 2005 Transportation Plan. 
 
Street Design Standards 
 
The City and County Subdivision Regulations 
specify standards for street design based on 
functional classification.  The standards were 
updated and changed in 2006 with other amend-
ments to these regulations.  Based on these stan-
dards, the typical street section designs require-
ments are shown in Tables 1 and 2. 
 

RURAL TRANSPORTATION 
 
County Roads and Bridges 
 
Yellowstone County maintains approximately 
1,500 miles of public and County roads.  Public 
roads are distinguished from County roads in 
that they have been expressly dedicated for pub-
lic use, but were not formally petitioned and ap-
proved as in the case of County roads.  The 
County Public Works Department maintains the 
County road network. 
 
There are approximately 240 bridges in Yellow-
stone County and thousands of culverts.  These 
include all bridges in the City as well as the 
County. 
 
Roads in Yellowstone County may also be pri-
vately owned.  These roads are generally desig-
nated as private at the time of subdivision plat-
ting.  For roads to be considered private, they 
must restrict access to the general public.  In 
some cases, this is accomplished by gating or 
signage indicating private use only. 
 
The Bureau of Land Reclamation (BLR) is also 
the owner of an estimated 54 miles of public 
road in the Huntley Project area.  These roads 
were originally platted in 1907 and ownership 

was retained by the BLR.  The County and the 
BLR are negotiating transferring the ownership 
of the Huntley Project roads at this time.  The 
primary issue to resolve is whether or not fund-
ing will be available to bring these roads up to 
County standards. 
 
Funding for Maintenance 
 
Funding for maintenance of County and public 
roads comes from the County Road and Bridge 
tax levies, gas tax funds, and from Rural Special 
Improvement Districts (RSIDs).  The voters ap-
proved a road mill levy increase of 4.03 mills for 
FY01 bringing the total mills to 23.16 from 
15.97 in FY00.  This mill levy increased slightly 
in FY02 to 24.36.  In FY07 the road mill levy 
was 32.48.  City residents do not pay this mill 
levy but do contribute to the County Bridge 
Fund.  The Bridge Fund mill levy was 2.80 in 
FY01 and 2.91 in FY02, in FY07 the bridge 
fund mill was 5.58.  Most rural subdivisions that 
are serviced by internal public roads also pay an 
annual assessment for road maintenance through 
the RSID mechanism.  There were approxi-
mately 170 RSIDs active in the County in 
2002008.  Other sources of revenue for the Road 
and Bridge Department are Federal and State 
grants and cost sharing.  The Road and Bridge 
Division actively promotes cost-share projects 
with property owners.  Cost-share projects are 
limited to roads where the Division has had an 
historical maintenance responsibility. 
 

AIR QUALITY 
 
Based on air quality measurement collected in 
1977, the City of Billings was categorized as 
nonattainment “Not Classified” for carbon mon-
oxide (CO) by the U. S. Environmental Protec-
tion Agency (EPA).  This meant that Billings 
exceeded the National Ambient Air Quality 
Standards mandated by the National Clean Air 
Act. Because of this designation, Billings was 
required to prepare an implementation plan to 
bring the area into compliance with the national 
air quality standards.  As part of the 2000 Trans-
portation Plan, a regional emissions analysis was 
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performed to demonstrate the proposed plan 
would not adversely affect air quality. 
 
Beginning with a baseline year of 1996, future 
estimates of transportation-related emissions 
were determined for the horizon years of 2000, 
2010, 2020.  The results of this analysis indi-
cated that emissions would decrease because, by 
implementing the Transportation Plan, traffic 
congestion would decrease and future cars and 
trucks would be less polluting. 
 
This analysis became the basis for redesignating 
the Billings “not classified” carbon monoxide 
nonattainment area to attainment for the carbon 
monoxide National Ambient Air Quality Stan-
dard (NAAQS).  The EPA approved the redesig-
nation of Billings from nonattainment for CO to 
attainment and approved the maintenance plan 
that is designed to keep the area in attainment 
for CO for the next 10 years. 
 
Yellowstone County regularly monitors air pol-
lutants at nine monitoring stations around Bill-
ings and Laurel in order to comply with regula-
tions imposed by several authorities, including 
the Yellowstone County Air Pollution Control, 
the Montana Department of Environmental 
Quality, and the US Environmental Protection 
Agency.  The regulations require monitoring 
sulfur dioxide, carbon monoxide, nitrogen ox-
ides, ozone, and particulate levels from major 
sources and also from the cumulative effect of 
all sources in the region. 
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4.8 OPEN SPACE AND RECREATION 
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
Parks and recreational facilities, as well as natural 
areas, are an integral part of the quality of life in 
the community.  They provide opportunities for 
citizens and visitors to enjoy their surroundings 
and enjoy their environment through recreational 
and aesthetic pursuits.  Open space and recrea-
tional areas are the amenities that shape a com-
munity and make it a desirable place to live and 
work. 
 
Several entities within Yellowstone County ad-
minister and maintain parkland, open space and 
recreational sites including; the Federal govern-
ment, the State, the County, the City of Billings, 
the Yellowstone River Parks Association, the 
Town of Broadview, and the City of Laurel. The 
City of Laurel and its surrounding Planning Juris-
diction is under a separate Growth Policy Docu-
ment and its parks and open space areas are not 
included in this document. 
 
FEDERAL RECREATION AREAS 
 
The U. S. Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
administers several recreational sites in Yellow-
stone County for public use. 
 
Pompeys Pillar 
Pompeys Pillar itself has been declared a National 
Monument and the area around the site is desig-
nated as a National Historic Landmark.   It is lo-
cated along the Yellowstone River at the site 
where Captain Clark stopped along his journey to 
etch his name in the sandstone pillar.  There is an 
information museum on the site and the area that 
includes 566 acres is available for hiking, fishing 
and wildlife viewing.  The approximate visitation 
for fiscal year October 2000-September 2001 was 
45,000 visitors. Visitation for 2007 was 50,000 
for the visitor center and 15,000 dispersed around 
the facilities. 
 
 
 
 

 
Sundance Lodge Recreational Area 
This area is located south of the Yellowstone 
River along River Road between Billings and 
Laurel.  The primary use of this area is for hiking, 
horseback riding, fishing, and wildlife viewing.  
It contains 380 acres and the approximate visita-
tion for fiscal year October 2000-September 2001 
was 2,000 visitors. Visitation for 2007 was 3,644. 
 
Shepherd, Ah-Nei 
This area is located approximately 9 miles north-
east of Shepherd on the CA Road.  The primary 
use of this area is for environmental education, 
off-highway vehicles, snow play, hunting, and 
bicycling and contains 3,602 acres.  The approxi-
mate visitation for fiscal year October 2000-
September 2001 was 3,250 visitors. Visitation is 
separated into two areas.  The OHV area is ap-
proximately 1,000 acres and is used primarily for 
OHV use (ATVs and motorcycles).  Visitation for 
the OHV area for 2007 was 10,300 visitors. Dis-
persed use in an additional non motorized portion 
of the recreation area (approx. 4000 acres) is used 
for hiking, horseback riding, mountain biking, 
picnicking, hunting, and birdwatching.  Visitation 
for 2007 recorded under “dispersed use” was 
5,400. 
 
 
 
 

The new Pompeys Pillar Interpretive Center 
was completed in 2006, and features exhibits 
in a 5,700 square foot center, paved trails and 
an amphitheater. Photo credit: Billings Gazette. 
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17-Mile 
This area is located approximately 14 miles north 
of Billings on Montana Highway 87 and west on 
Crooked Creek Road.  17-Mile is used for target 
practice, hiking, hunting (upland bird).  The area 
contains 2,080 acres.  The approximate visitation 
for fiscal year October 2000-September 2001 was 
3,000 visitors. Visitation for 2007 was 12,149. 
 
Acton 
The Acton area is located 25 miles northwest of 
Billings on Montana Highway 3 and then 6 miles 
east on Oswald Road.   The primary use of this 
area is for hiking, horseback riding, hunting and 
snow play.  The area contains 3,800 acres.  The 
visitation for fiscal year October 2000-September 
2001 was approximately 2,500 visitors. 2007 visi-
tation was 7,706. 
 
Four Dances Natural Area 
This 764 acre natural area is located south of Bill-
ings and south of the Yellowstone River off Inter-
state 90, Lockwood exit.  The primary use is for 
hiking.  BLM estimates visitation for fiscal year 
October 2000-September 2001 was 2,750 visi-
tors. Visitation for 2007 was 6,646. 
 
South Hills Off-Road Vehicle (OHV) Area 
There are 1,270 acres located southeast off South 
Billings Boulevard adjacent to the Old Blue 
Creek Road set aside for OHV-motorcycle riding.  
The approximate visitation for fiscal year October 
2000-September 2001 was 4,600 visitors. South 
Hills Motorcycle Area 2007 visitation was 2,560 
visitors.  South Hills dispersed use was 8,833 
visitors. 
 
Steamboat Rock 
Steamboat Rock is located approximately 25 
miles northeast of Shepherd.  This is an open area 
for any recreational use.  There are no visitation 
records kept. 
The National Park Service along with the Friends 
of Canyon Creek manages the Canyon Creek 
Skirmish Site, a unit of the Nez Perce Historical 
Park Battlefield.  This half acre site is located 16 
miles north of Laurel on Buffalo Trail. 
 
 

STATE PARKS AND RECREATION AREAS 
 
The Montana Department of Fish, Wildlife, and 
Parks manages a number of outdoor recreation 
sites in Yellowstone County. 
 
Lake Elmo 
This 122 acre urban day-use park is located at 
2300 Lake Elmo Drive and attracts visitors to 
swim, sailboat, windsurf, and fish. A 1.4 mile 
trail is available for visitor use.  A display in the 
Fish, Wildlife & Parks headquarters located on 
site provides weekday interpretation of the park. 
During the summer, a concessionaire offers food 
and beverages.  The visitor count for 2007 was 
150,694, up 51,971 people from the 2000 visita-
tion numbers.  More information is available at 
www.fwp.mt.gov. 
 
Pictograph Cave 
This day-use site is located six miles south of 
Billings off the I-90 Lockwood exit at the end of 
Coburn Road. Pictograph Cave State Park was 
dedicated as a National Historic Landmark in 
1964.  Pictograph Cave is one of the key archaeo-
logical sites used in determining the sequence of 
prehistoric occupation in the northwest plains. 
The Pictograph, Middle and Ghost Cave complex 
was home to generations of prehistoric hunters. 
Over 30,000 artifacts have been identified from 
the park. A short trail allows you to view the rock 
paintings still visible in Pictograph Cave.   A visi-
tor center is scheduled to be constructed and open 
by July 2009.  It will be open year round and pro-
vide an interpretive display, classroom/meeting 
room and gift shop.  The visitor count for 2007 
was 40,105.  More information is available at:   
www.pictographcave.org. 
 
Yellowstone Wildlife Management Area/
Yellowstone River State Park 
This newly acquired land complex of over 4,000 
acres and 5.5 miles of Yellowstone river frontage 
provides public recreation access to land and wa-
ter-based sites for fishing, hunting, floating and 
other recreational activities.  It is located on the 
north side of the Yellowstone river from a half 
mile downstream (east) of Gritty Stone Access to 
a half mile west of Bundy Bridge.  This property 
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is contiguous with property owned by BLM cre-
ating a complex of over 10,000 acres of public 
recreational land.  Eventually the 200 acres on the 
east side of the property will be developed as the 
Yellowstone River State Park.   
 
Sportsman Accesses 
These access areas provide public recreation ac-
cess to land-based and water-based sites for fish-
ing, hunting, floating, and other recreational ac-
tivities.  Management of these facilities includes 
the protection of the on-site resources and adja-
cent private lands.  Minimum facilities and devel-
opments are allowed consistent, with recreation 
use and resource protection. 
 
The Yellowstone River flows through the length 
of Yellowstone County and provides many water 
recreational opportunities for the area.  The fol-
lowing are the public access points along the Yel-
lowstone River. 
 
• Buffalo Mirage ( 7 miles E. of Laurel on I-90 

at Park City exit, then 6 miles SE on county 
road) located at  river mile 387.0 

• Riverside Park (at Laurel on south side of the 
river on Hwy. 310) located at river mile 384.7 

• Duck Creek  (south of Billings, off 56th St.), 
located at river mile 374.6 

• South Hills (south of Billings, off South Bill-
ings Blvd.) located at river mile 365.6 

• East Bridge (Lockwood Bridge access off I-
90) located south of the river at river mile 
360.6 

• Coulson Park (Billings’ City Park) west of 
Interstate 90 Bridge on north side at river 
mile 361 

• Gritty Stone (by Worden) located at river 
mile 337.3 

• Voyagers Rest ( by Ballantine) located at 
river mile 334.9 

• Bundy Bridge (by Pompey’s Pillar) located 
on the north side of the river at river mile 
328.7 

• Captain Clark (8 miles W. of Custer on the 
Frontage Road) located at river mile 310.6  

 
 
 

NAVIGABLE WATERWAYS 
 
Yellowstone River 
The Yellowstone River provides a continuous, 
navigable waterway through Yellowstone 
County.  It is the longest free flowing river in the 
lower 48 states. The river adds to the aesthetic 
beauty of the region and provides water for farm-
ing and municipal water supplies, as well as pro-
viding many recreational opportunities for the 
community including fishing, boating and other 
water-based activities.  The river may be navi-
gated by small non-motorized crafts such as kay-
aks, canoes, rafts and drift boats.  Jet boats are the 
most common motorized craft on the river due to 
the variable water depths. 
 
Bighorn 
The fishing on the Big Horn River is legendary.  
The Bighorn River flows north out of the Bighorn 
Canyon Reservoir at Fort Smith. The “blue rib-
bon” fisheries lie predominantly in Big Horn 
County although the last 12 miles of the Big Horn 
River forms the east boundary of Yellowstone 
County before it enters the Yellowstone River.  
The river can be navigated with power jet boats 
up from the confluence for about 4 miles until the 
Manning Irrigation Dam, but most anglers prefer 
the non-motorized canoes and drift boats. 
 
Clarks Fork  
The Clarks Fork of the Yellowstone River enters 
the Yellowstone River near Laurel which is at the 
western end of Yellowstone County.  Most of the 
year the river is turbid so it may not support any 
game fisheries in Yellowstone County.  Above 
Yellowstone County where the water is clear 
there is excellent brown and rainbow trout fish-
ing.  The lower end of the Clark’s Fork would be 
good floating, but there is limited public access. 
 
YELLOWSTONE COUNTY PARKLAND 
 
The County Park Board adopted the Yellowstone 
County Park Plan in 1984.  The plan inventoried 
existing parks throughout Yellowstone County.  
Each park was classified according to size, ser-
vice area and degree of development.  Descrip-
tions of the County parkland classes are listed 
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below. There is an estimated 1,784 acres of public 
and private park land in Yellowstone County, ac-
cording to a 2008 inventory estimate completed by 
the Yellowstone County GIS Department. 
 
Parkland Classifications: 
 
• Neighborhood Park/Playground (NPP) 
Day use parks of limited size providing close to 
home opportunities for a variety of unstructured 
active and passive recreation activities.  Parks  
serve all ages with an emphasis on ages 5 – 18. 
 
• Neighborhood Mini-Park (NMP) 
Small day use parks retained to accommodate vari-
ous activities desired and developed by neighbor-
hood or special interest groups.  These parks are 
most viable in urban areas or in the context of 
small lot, multiple family or mobile home residen-
tial developments. 
 
• Neighborhood Open Space (NOS) 
Open space to preserve or enhance the environ-
mental quality of the neighborhood.  Parks may 
preserve natural features, act as buffers and pro-
vide limited recreational opportunities. 
 
• Community Natural Areas/Open Space 

(CNA) 
Parks preserve areas of high natural resource value 
or special natural or environmental features.  They 
provide opportunities for passive recreation and 
study of the natural environment or conserve fea-
tures of community significance (i.e., rims, river). 
 
• Community Playfields (CPF) 
A Community Playfield is a large outdoor recrea-
tion area developed primarily to serve the active 
recreational needs of the junior and senior high 
school ages and adults of the community.  Play-
fields provide specialized facilities for daytime 
and evening programmed activities. 
 
• Community Park-Multiple Use (CMU) 
Multiple Use Community parks are designed to 
provide a wide variety of recreational opportuni-
ties.  Parks provide for day and evening use by all 
segments of the population.  Ideally, these parks 
incorporate elements of community natural areas 

and playfields as well as less structured activities 
within an ornamental landscape setting.  The lar-
ger size community park allows for a variety of 
non-conflicting uses. 
 
• Major Park (MJR) 
Major Parks are considered large resource based 
park, designed to provide large number of people 
with a wide variety of recreational day and eve-
ning uses.  Major Parks provide for both intensive 
uses and passive pursuits within a natural setting 
or landscape setting.  Facilities are provided to 
serve all segments of the population. 
 
• Regional Park (R) 
Regional Parks serve multi-governmental units 
and are usually administered by a regional body.  
These parks provide a wide range of day and over-
night uses.  Regional Parks are usually natural re-
source based and are developed to serve the entire 
population.  Often large portions of the land area 
remain undeveloped for the purpose of preserving 
significant areas of the natural landscape or to pro-
vide extensive open space or greenbelt areas. 
 
• Single/Special Use Facility (SU) 
Special Use Facilities provide unique recreational 
opportunities to a variety of age groups.  Central 
feature may be a golf course, zoo, historic site, 
festival, amphitheatre or ski areas.  Special Use 
Facilities often serve the entire region or state and 
may attract population from a larger base. 
 
• Recreation Corridor (RC) 
Recreation Corridors are linear parks establish ex-
tensive and continuous strips of land and water 
dedicated to recreational travel including hiking, 
biking, horseback riding, cross country skiing and 
canoeing.  Recreation Corridors serve the entire 
community population. 
 
• Excess Lands (EX) 
The Excess Land classification qualifies lands 
with limited or no recreational potential for dispo-
sition or sale.  Revenues generated will be used to 
maintain and develop existing County parks or to 
acquire additional, needed parklands.  
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PARK NAME ACRES 
AGRI-CENTER SUB PARK 2.01 
ARROW ISLAND SUB 2ND PARK 24.13 
ARROW ISLAND SUB PARK 15.36 
BALLANTINE PARK 1.21 
BEARTOOTH VIEW PARK 1.09 
BEL AIRE PARK 1.19 
BROOKDALE PARK 1.82 
BROOKWOOD SUB PARK A 2.82 
BROOKWOOD SUB PARK B 0.92 
BROOKWOOD SUB PARK C 1 
BROOKWOOD SUB PARK D 2.74 
BROOKWOOD SUB PARK E 0.77 
BROOKWOOD SUB PARK F 0.14 
CARLA ISLANDS PARK 52.47 
CENTURY PARK 5.7 
CHARLES RUSSELL PARK 3.64 
CLOVERLEAF MEADOWS PARK 7.28 

CLYDESDALE PARK 6.33 
COULSON NORTH 2.1 
COULSON PARK 53.48 
COUNTY LAND - CUSTER 4.26 
COUNTY PARK 4.48 
COUNTY PARK - CUSTER 0.17 
COVE CREEK SUB PARK 1.58 
CRYSTAL SPRINGS PARK 1.64 
CS 1261 PARK 2.43 
CS 704 PARK 0.96 
CUSTER VOL. FIRE-CNTY PARK 0.31 
DE CARLO PARK 0.64 
DRIFTWOODS SUB PARK 1.8 
DRIFTWOODS SUB PARK 0.84 
DRY CREEK PARK 1.9 
ECHO CANYON SUB PARK 15.33 
EGGEBRECHT PARK 4.58 
EMERALD EAGLE ESTATES SUB PARK 2.9 
EMERALD HILLS PARK 15.12 
FALCON HEIGHTS PARK 9.61 
GRANITE PARK SUB PARK 4.99 
GROSHELLE HEIGHTS SUB PARK 0.98 
GRUHLKE SUB PARK 0.92 
HAKERT PARK 0.85 
HARRIS PARK 2.4 
HIDDEN LAKE SUB PARK 19.16 
HIGH POINT PARK 9.58 
HIGH POINT SUB PARK 0.65 
HIGHLAND PARK ADDN SHEPHERD 0.4 
HILLNER PARK 7.31 
HOMESTEAD PARK 4.15 

HOMEWOOD PARK 7.1 
INDEPENDENCE PARK 2.05 
INDIAN CLIFFS SUB 1ST PARK 3.23 
INDIAN CLIFFS SUB 1ST PVT PARK 1.55 
INDIAN CLIFFS SUB 2ND PARK 27.9 
JOSEPHINE/BIG SKY ISLANDS PARK 58.19 
KING AVE ESTATES NO.2 SUB PARK 2.48 
KIWANIS TRAIL 13.81 
LACKMAN SUB PARK 0.67 
LAUREL RESERVOIR 14.26 
LEWIS SUB PARK 0.85 
LINLEE LAKE ESTATES SUB PARK 16.63 
LITTLE DUDE PARK 2 
LOCKWOOD 10.15 
LOCKWOOD SCHOOL PARK LAND 13.16 
MADSEN PARK 1.26 
MCKENZIE PARK 9.87 
MONTANA MEADOWS SUB PARK 10.82 
MUSTANG SUB (PARK) 3.39 
NAOMI PARK 16.69 
NUTTING BROTHERS SUB 3RD PARK 3.25 
ODONNELL PARK 3.86 
OSBORN PARK 12.49 
OXBOW PARK 10.42 
PELICAN RV PLAZA SUB PARK 0.61 
PHEASANT BROOK SUB BLK 2 PARK 1.09 
PHEASANT BROOK SUB BLK 4 PARK 5.26 
PHIPPS PARK 347.4 
PIKE PARK 5.27 
PINE HILL SUB PARK 8.31 
PLENTY COUP SUB PARK 12.87 
POMPEYS PILLAR PARK 0.32 
PRAIRIE PARK 7.02 
PRYOR CREEK ESTATES SUB PARK 6.1 
PRYOR HILLS SUB 2ND FIL PARK 1.3 
Q PARK 1.58 
QUANTA PARK 2.41 
QUANTA SUB PARK 0.57 
QUARTER HORSE PARK 4.98 
RIMROCK PARK (Rimrock) 0.9 
RIVER VISTA TRACTS PARK 13.28 
RIVERFRONT PARK 284.43 
RIVERFRONT PARK (CITY LAND) 13.01 
RIVERSIDE PARK 28.5 
RIVERSIDE PARK HUNTLEY 4.48 
RONAN COTTONWOOD PARK 9.59 
SADDLEBACK RIDGE EST. 2ND PARK 5.07 
SANNON PARK 2.61 
SCHAUER PARK 1.87 
SCHOENTHAL ISLAND 92.97 

Table 1. Yellowstone County Parks  
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Source: Yellowstone County GIS Department, 2008 
 
Leased County parkland is currently in the inven-
tory of parklands, but is not being used for recrea-
tional purposes. Rather, they are leased for farm-
ing, ranching or special use.  These parcels in-
clude: 
• Arrow Island I (east of Shepherd) 
• Arrow Island II (east of Shepherd) 
• Cove Creek Park (Echo Canyon) 
• Falcon Heights (for mobile home)  
 (Blue Creek) 
• River Vista (east of Shepherd) 
• Sharptail (King and Shiloh) 
• Valley (Blue Creek) 
• West Park (west of Laurel) 
• Winchester (Shepherd) 
• Zimmerman (for cell tower) 
 
Special use facilities and land, such as Oscar’s 
Dreamland and MetraPark, are included in the 
City of Billings Parkland Inventory. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

CITY OF BILLINGS PARKLAND 
 
This City parkland information is derived from 
the Parks2020 Billings Parks, Recreation, and 
Open Space Master Plan that was adopted Janu-
ary 27, 1997 prepared for the City Parks, Recrea-
tion and Cemetery Board.  The Park Board con-
sists of nine members and is advisory only.   The 
City Parks, Recreation, and Public Lands Depart-
ment (PRPL) provides staff support to the board. 
 
PRPL is currently working on a park inventory of 
all City owned land that is identified as parkland.  
Also included in the inventory is land owned by 
the City or other public agencies but managed by 
the PRPL.  While the exact number of acres is 
still to be identified, conservatively PRPL has 
management responsibility of well over 2,700 
acres of parkland. 
 
Since the development of the Parks 2020 Billings 
Parks, Recreation, and Open Space Master Plan, 
PRPL has made minor adjustments in the descrip-
tion and classification of parkland in an effort to 
clarify and be more descriptive of nationally rec-
ognized parkland classifications and trends.  The 
national classification system used is described in 
the National Recreation and Parks Association 
(NRPA) publication titled Park, Recreation, Open 
Space and Greenway Guidelines published in 
1996.  The adjustments appear in the Recreation 
Parks section below. 
 
The mission of PRPL is twofold.  First is to ac-
quire, develop and maintain parkland for the ac-
tive and passive recreational use and enjoyment 
of the Citizens of Billings.  The second aspect of 
the mission is to acquire and manage lands pri-
marily for conservation of significant physical, 
cultural, natural or visual resource value in an 
effort to preserve the special character of this 
Montana region.  Thus the lands managed by 
PRPL fall into two broad categories, Recreation 
Parks and Natural Resource Areas. 
 
 
 
 
 

SHAMROCK ACREAGE TRTS SUB PARK 1.45 

SHARON PARK 4.09 

SHAWNEE PARK 1.42 

SIERRA ESTATES SUB 1ST PARK 1.55 

SIERRA ESTATES SUB 2ND PARK 4.82 

SIERRA ESTATES SUB 3RD PARK 8.25 

SLED PARK 8.77 

SUN VALLEY SUB 1ST PARK 9.09 

TWO MOON PARK 172.94 

VALLEY PARK 3.24 

WELLS GARDEN PARK 8.77 

WEST MEADOWS SUB PARK 15.62 

WEST PARK 6.54 

WILSON PARK 14.32 

WINCHESTER SUB PARK 3.21 

WORDEN PARK 3.57 

ZIMMERMAN PUBLIC PARK 102.31 

ZIMMERMAN SUB 4TH PARK 0.99 

Total County Park Acreage 1,785 
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Recreation Parks 
 
The most easily identified parks in the system are 
the recreation parks which are centers of activity 
and host to many community and neighborhood 
events.  Recreation parks are identified and char-
acterized as follows: 
 
• Mini-Parks 
Used to address limited, isolated or unique rec-
reational or cultural needs.  Mini-Parks are rare 
and usually occupy an acre or less.  The service 
area will vary based on activities and location. 
 
• Neighborhood Park 
The neighborhood park is the basic unit of the 
park system and serves as the recreational and 
social focus of the neighborhood.  Their main 
function is for informal active and passive recrea-
tion.  The main feature in this type of park is 
“programmable open space”.  This means that 
among other features, the park contains open 
space in sufficient size for a variety of recrea-
tional programs and activities; it does not have a 
single programmed use (i.e. a baseball field).  A 
neighborhood park is a minimum of 5 acres in 
size with 5 to 10 acres considered as optimal.  
This type of parks should be centrally located 
within its service radius which encompasses a ¼ 
to ½ mile distance uninterrupted by non-
residential roads and other physical barriers.  
Ease of access and walking distance are critical 
factors in locating this park. 
 
• School-Park 
Depending on circumstances, combining the re-
sources of two public agencies, the School-Park 
allows for expanding the recreation, social and 
educational opportunities available to the commu-
nity in an efficient and cost effective manner.  
Depending on its size and location, this type of 
park may serve a number of capacities in park 
classification.  Location of a School-Park is deter-
mined by school district property.  Size of the 
park varies depending on function. 
 
• Community Park 
A Community Park serves broader community-
based recreation needs as well as preserving 

unique landscapes and open spaces.  They allow 
for group activities and offer other recreational 
opportunities both active and passive on a city 
wide scale.  The location of these parks are deter-
mined by quality and suitability of the site.  These 
parks are appropriate sites for special use facili-
ties such as aquatic facilities and activity centers.  
They have a service area of from ½ to 3 miles in 
distance.  The size of a Community Park varies 
but should accommodate the desired uses and 
range from 30 to 50 acres. 
 
• Large Urban Park 
These parks serve the entire community.  Large 
Urban Parks are likely to have structures and fa-
cilities geared to large groups and events.  Loca-
tion becomes an important factor because of the 
need for participants to access major transporta-
tion corridors.  The size should accommodate the 
desired uses and range from 50 to 75 acres or 
more. 
 
• Sports Complex 
Are heavily programmed athletic fields and asso-
ciated facilities strategically located and designed 
to serve the entire community.  Accessibility 
from major transportation corridors is an impor-
tant factor in location.  Size is determined by pro-
jected demand and are a minimum of 25 acres 
with 40 to 80 acres considered optimal.  Sighting 
of these facilities is crucial because of their in-
tense and extended use so that activities do not 
interfere with adjacent property owners. 
 
• Special Use Park 
This classification covers a broad range of parks 
and recreation facilities that are oriented to a sin-
gle use.  Location and size are variable depending 
on the use. 
 
• Private Park 
These are parks and recreation facilities that are 
privately owned yet contribute to the public park 
and recreation system by providing programs and 
activities to the community.  Consideration is 
given to these parks when the same or similar 
programs are contemplated in City owned park-
land. 
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Natural Resource Areas 
 
These are lands set aside and managed for preser-
vation of significant natural resources, remnant 
landscapes, open space, visual aesthetics and or 
buffering.  Natural Resource 
Areas are characterizes as follows: 
 
• Conservation Areas 
Conservation Areas are lands set aside primarily 
for the conservation of natural features and sensi-
tive habitat.  These areas include flood plains, 
scenic resources, wetlands, and unique natural 
areas such as the rims, the Yellowstone River and 
its tributaries.  Recreational pursuits are passive, 
including walking, nature study, interpretive ac-
tivities, photography, and wildlife watching. 
 
• Special Use Facilities and Lands 
Special Use facilities include cultural facilities, 
conservation, recreation, or open land resources, 
which contribute to or enhance the community’s 
parks, open spaces, or recreational opportunities.  
These lands may or may not be managed by the 
City. 
 
• Urban Greenspace 
Urban Greenspace includes landscaped parks, 
whose primary purpose is to provide visual relief 
to the built environment.  Lands may include 
buffer strips between land uses, landscape devel-
opment along transportation corridors, or land-
scaping at community gateways. 
 
• Multifunctional Areas 
Multifunctional parks incorporate many func-
tions, balancing scenic, cultural, and natural re-
source conservation with developed recreational 
opportunities.  These parks offer diverse resource
-based recreational pursuits, including boating, 
river sports, hiking, climbing, fishing, and wild-
life watching.  Riverfront and Swords Parks are 
good examples of existing Multifunctional Areas. 
 
• Undeveloped Park Lands 
Undeveloped lands are those parcels that have 
been purchased, donated or contributed to the 
City that are not yet developed with park facili-
ties.  Land is most commonly contributed by de-

velopers who are required by state statute and 
City Subdivision Regulations to make a parkland 
dedication (or give Cash-in Lieu) when a tract of 
land is developed.  These lands are not formally 
managed and are administered by the City PRPL 
Department.   Undeveloped park lands are banked 
until funding and resources become available for 
their development. 
 
• Greenways 
Greenways are corridors of land managed to pro-
vide a variety of functions, which may include 
recreation, conservation, transportation, infra-
structure, or community shaping.  Greenways are 
linear corridors, comprised of private and public 
lands.  Greenways do not necessarily include 
public access or recreational opportunities al-
though ideally they would incorporate both.  
They would also provide connecting pathways 
used by cyclists, walkers, runners, skaters, and 
strollers.  Greenways include vegetation, natural 
or ornamental, as an essential component to add 
bio-diversity and scenic value.  Greenways can 
also include  the Heritage Trail system.  The Yel-
lowstone River Greenway Master Plan is another 
important plan that maps out desirable greenway 
corridors exclusively along the Yellowstone 
River.  These conservation corridors should be 
acquired as a buffer between urban development 
and the regions natural resources. 
 
• Open Space 
Open space is defined as: “all land and water in 
an urban area, not covered by buildings, which 
has value for park and recreation purposes, con-
servation of land and other natural resources, or 
historic or scenic purposes.”  Park lands contrib-
ute to, but do not fully comprise, the community 
open space system.  Similar to greenways, these 
lands may or may not be administered by PRPL. 
 
• Urban Forest 
The Urban Forest includes trees planted on public 
and private lands in developed areas.  Developing 
and maintaining the urban forest is a community 
responsibility.  The urban forest should be devel-
oped and enhanced in the entire urbanized area.  
Street tree planting and maintenance should occur 
as a result of incentive programs and regulations. 
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• Scenic Resources 
Scenic Resources include views and landscape 
features which have been identified as important 
to the community’s sense of place.  These are 
generally noted on The Parks2020 Master Plan.  
A comprehensive open space study as part of a 
growth management plan would further refine the 
priorities and map important view corridors. 
 
OTHER OPEN SPACE 
 
Open Lands include state and federal lands, unde-
veloped lands, and public utility lands.  Open 
Lands shown on the master plan illustrate the cur-
rent conditions, based on zoning and ownership, 
rather than established community priorities for 
open space. 
 
There are several agencies and groups, such as 
the Nature Conservancy, the Montana Land Reli-
ance and Mid-Yellowstone Land Trust that oper-
ate within Yellowstone County and are concerned 
with conservation easements and preserving open 
spaces for the future of the community.  These 
groups may be involved with land that is pro-
tected but does not provide any recreational op-
portunities for public use. 
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4.9 CULTURAL AND HISTORIC  

RESOURCES 
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
Yellowstone County has been inhabited over the 
last 12,000 years and the remains of human activ-
ity can be found virtually everywhere.   Approxi-
mately 450 of the more than 23,000 archaeologi-
cal and historical sites identified in Montana are 
located in Yellowstone County.   The majority of 
these sites are located in or near the Yellowstone 
River valley.   
 
Yellowstone County and the area that is now Bill-
ings were also prominent throughout the recorded 
history in Montana.   
 
A BRIEF HISTORY OF BILLINGS AND  
YELLOWSTONE COUNTY 
 
Since the time when prehistoric man first inhab-
ited the Yellowstone Valley some 12,000 years 
ago, the land and the people who lived here have 
experienced many changes.  Great mammals, 
which have now disappeared, once roamed the 
area and were an important source of food for 
small groups of hunters and gatherers.  Today 
farming, ranching, energy development, and pro-
viding goods and services to the region are the 
activities of most residents. 
 
The earliest inhabitants lived off the land, taking 
their tools, clothing, shelter, and food from what 
nature provided for them.  Their weapons, spears 
and atlatls, killed the mammoth, bison, and camel 
which were their food.  Fiber from yucca plants 
was twisted into rope, and hide was the raw mate-
rial for clothing and shelters.  When large game 
was in short supply due to harsh winters or 
drought, the natives survived on berries, seeds, 
and small animals. 
 
About 11,000 years ago the extinction of large 
prehistoric animals occurred in the Yellowstone 
Region.  Between 6,500 and 4,000 years ago, the 
Yellowstone Valley experienced an extended pe-
riod of warmer, drier weather that left the plains a 

virtual desert, which was less hospitable to mam-
mals and humans.  During this period, humans 
moved from the prairie to the mountains where 
vegetation was more varied and small animals 
would support the human population.  As the cli-
mate moderated, they moved out of the moun-
tains and returned to the plains.  The modern bi-
son evolved and was hunted by native popula-
tions who had developed more sophisticated 
weapons such as the bow and arrow, which were 
introduced about 2,000 to 1,500 years ago.  Great 
migrations of humans took place during this time 
period. 
 
Evidence of this journey is recorded in picto-
graphs, petroglyphs, pottery, and vessels left be-
hind by tribes, such as the Shoshone.  The Crow, 
who had been sedentary farmers, moved to the 
Yellowstone Valley and became hunters and trad-
ers.  Other tribes living in the Yellowstone area 
included the Assiniboine, Sioux, Cheyenne, Flat-
head, Blackfeet, Arapaho, and Gros Ventres.  By 
the mid 1600s, the horse, which was gained in 
trade or stolen from enemies, had been introduced 
in Montana, and began to change the native way 
of life.  On horseback, a person could travel far-
ther and faster in pursuit of buffalo, the mainstay 
of his existence.  Warriors were more able to de-
fend the land against enemies, whether white men 
or other warring tribes.  During the early 1800s, 
Captain William Clark, along with several mem-
bers of the expedition, fur trappers, traders and 
missionaries traveled through the Yellowstone 
Valley.  In 1853, Col. Isaac Stevens, along with 
Captain John Mullan of the US Army, was as-
signed the task of preparing a preliminary survey 
of the Yellowstone Valley for the future railroad.  
The US Army established posts along the Yel-
lowstone to maintain a semblance of peace and 
protect the use of the river for transportation.   
 
By the mid-1800s, the area’s population had in-
creased considerably and the Army began driving 
the Sioux onto the reservations in South Dakota.  
The Crow Reservation was established in 1851 
and stretched across what is now south central 
Montana, south of the Yellowstone River.  The 
reservation was reduced to its current size in 
1868.  By 1876, skirmishes with the Sioux had 
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reached serious proportions; Fort Pease was held 
under siege for nine months in 1875; Baker’s Bat-
tle took place near Huntley in 1872; and the fight 
with the Sioux climaxed at the Battle of Little Big 
Horn on June 25, 1876.  Following a brutal cam-
paign, the Army succeeded in driving the Sioux 
and the Cheyenne on to the reservations or across 
the boarder into Canada.  In an epic attempt to 
retreat to Canada, the Nez Perce were also pur-
sued and skirmished on Canyon Creek, five miles 
north of Laurel.  The Canyon Creek Battle was 
fought in 1877.  By the 1880s, the Indian Wars 
ceased and the buffalo had been exterminated.  
Meanwhile, a small town was developing along 
the Yellowstone River, known by the name of 
Coulson. 

 
By 1883, Coulson was a thriving burg containing 
a telegraph office, store, saloon, hotel, and saw-
mill.  It was near this site where the steamboat 
Josephine, commanded by Captain Grant Marsh, 
landed in June 1875.  On his way up the Yellow-
stone River, Capt. Marsh engraved the name of 
his vessel in Pompeys Pillar, along side the in-
scription made by Captain William Clark in 1806.  
The Northern Pacific Railroad, unfortunately, 
bypassed Coulson, preferring the higher bench 
land.  Seizing the opportunity, the Minnesota and 
Montana Land and Improvement Company pur-
chased 800 acres 2 miles north of Coulson and 
platted the townsite of Billings in 1882.  As if by 

magic, Billings, named after the past president of 
the Northern Pacific Railroad, sprang from open 
prairie to flourishing town overnight.  Within four 
weeks of platting, the land company sold 5,000 
lots in the original townsite.  Billings incorpo-
rated in 1885.  Montana became the 41st state in 
the Union in 1889. 
 
Yellowstone County’s early development was 
less than magical.  The County was formed in 
1883, but its boundary went through several relo-
cations before settling on its final configuration.  
Originally carved from a large section of Custer 
County, the boundaries of Yellowstone County 
were rearranged by the formation of Sweet Grass, 
Musselshell, Carbon, Bighorn and Stillwater 
Counties.  The County, however, did benefit from 
the number of large, productive farms and 
ranches and established a strong agricultural-
based economy.   Only through hard work and the 
introduction of new farming methods and drought 
resistant crops and livestock could agriculture 
flourish in the semi-arid conditions.  Probably 
most important to cultivating the Yellowstone 
Valley was the construction of an extensive irri-
gation system.  The Billings Bench Water Asso-
ciation was instrumental in bringing irrigation 
water to the high benches north of Alkali Creek. 
It was the Bureau of Reclamation that brought 
irrigation to the Huntley Project area in 1907, 
making it feasible for people to own small, pro-
ductive parcels of land.   
 
Agriculture, while still an important industry in 
Yellowstone County, has taken its place among 
more important economic sectors.  The County 
has benefited from coal development in Mussel-
shell, Carbon and Rosebud County, from palla-
dium-platinum mining in Stillwater County and 
oil and gas development throughout the Powder 
River Basin.  Billings and Yellowstone County 
continue to be the regional economic hub, al-
though the main economic sectors today are com-
mercial retail and wholesale, and private and gov-
ernment services.  
 
 
 
 

Main Street, Coulson; c. 1882 
Source:  http://www.rootsweb.ancestry.com/
~mtygf/oldphotos.htm 
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CULTURAL SITES 
 
The history of Yellowstone County is docu-
mented by the scattered remnants of prehistoric 
and historic cultures.  From artifacts and evidence 
of earlier inhabitants, Yellowstone County can 
document a long period of human occupation.  
Key cultural and historic sites in the County are 
listed below.   
 
Prehistoric Sites 
 
Rock Art Sites 
 
Yellowstone County contains numerous rock art 
sites, dating as early as 750 A.D., which provide 
important information on the symbols of Native 
American religious life as well as on the histori-
cal patterns of use on the land.  An example of a 
Rock Art Site is Pictograph Caves State Park.  
The Montana Fish, Wildlife, and Parks Depart-
ment describes the site as follows: 
 
“Located just 6 miles south of Billings, the Picto-
graph, Middle and Ghost cave complex was home 
to generations of prehistoric hunters. Over 
30,000 artifacts have been identified from the 
park. A short paved trail allows you to view the 
rock paintings, known as pictographs that are 
still visible in Pictograph Cave, the largest of the 
three. Interpretive signs tell the story of Mon-
tana’s first professional archaeological studies 
and excavations. This site is listed as a National 
Historic Landmark”. 

Prehistoric Structures 
 
The most common form of prehistoric structure 
found in the County is the tipi ring, consisting of 
a circle of rocks used to hold down a hide lodge 
in windy conditions.  Far less common is the 
wooden lodge.  Both provide important informa-
tion about Native American family and commu-
nity patterns and activities. 
 
Native American Religious Sites 
 
Small rock cairns, vision quest structures, and 
eagle trapping pits are found on high points.  All 
have religious value to Native American groups.   
 
Battlement Sites 
 
A few rifle pit or battlement sites, dating after 
1750 A.D., are also known to exist in Yellow-
stone County.   
 
Rockshelters 
 
Shallow caves and rock overhangs like those at 
the “Indian Caves" were used by prehistoric peo-
ples in Yellowstone County.   
 
Burial Sites 
 
Most early historic and prehistoric human burials 
are located outside of registered cemeteries.  
Modern Native Americans feel a strong spiritual 
connection to ancient Indian burials.   
 
Camp Sites 
 
Some early human occupation sites are identified 
by the presence of "lithic scatter", i.e., scatters of 
discarded tools and flakes of various rock types 
which result from the manufacture or resharpen-
ing of stone tools.  These sites can provide infor-
mation on the age and use of an area, as well as 
on the human movement, activities, and trade that 
took place at the location.  
 
 
 
 

Pictograph State Park, located 6 miles south of 
Lockwood, contains evidence of habitation 
dating back over 4,500 years ago. 
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Bison Kill Sites 
 
Occasionally, Native Americans killed large 
numbers of big game at one event, either in a bi-
son jump or a bison trap.  Kill sites provide sig-
nificant information on the date and season of the 
kill, and the pattern of use of the animals from 
butchering marks present. 
 

Historic Sites 
 
Homestead Sites and Schools 
 
Homesteads, barns, sheds, and school houses, in 
their varying architectural styles, reflect the 
changing patterns of historic utilization of the 
land.   
 

TABLE 1 
YELLOWSTONE COUNTY PROPERTIES LISTED IN 

THE NATIONAL REGISTER 

Name Location Listing Date Reference Number 

Acme Building 109-111 N Broadway, Billings 11/09/2005 24YL1620 

Antelope Stage Station E. of Broadview, Broadview 01/19/1983 24YL257 

Abraham and Carrie Erb House 110 4th Avenue, Laurel 06/09/2005 Not assigned 

Armour Cold Storage 1 South Broadway, Billings 07/07/2004 24YL1583 

Billings Chamber of Commerce Building 303 N. 27th St., Billings 01/20/1972 24YL259 

Billings Historic District Roughly bounded by N. 23rd and 
N. 25th Sts., 1st and Montana 
Aves., Billings 

03/13/1979 24YL752 

Billings Townsite Historic District Bound-
ary Increase 

2600(2528), 2604-2606, 2608, 
2610-2614, and 2624 Montana 
Avenue, Billings 

04/21/2006 24YL0752 

Billings West Side School –also called 
Broadwater School 

415 Broadwater Ave, Billings 03/20/2002 24YL196 

Black Otter Trail Black Otter Trail 01/05/2007 24YL1580 

Boothill Cemetery 6th Ave. and Main St., Billings 04/17/1979 24YL755 

Electric Building 113-115 Broadway, Billings 03/01/2002 24YL1539 

Fire House No. 2 201 S. 30th St., Billings 02/29/1980 24YL261 

Hoskins Basin Archeological District Address Restricted 11/20/1974 24YL1031 

Masonic Temple 2806 Third Ave. N, Billings 04/17/1986 24YL260 

Moss, Preston B., House – also called 
the Moss Mansion. 

914 Division, Billings, 04/30/1982 24YL263 

North, Austin, House 622 N. 29th St., Billings 11/23/1977 24YL258 

O'Donnell, I. D., House 105 Clark Ave, Billings 11/23/1977 24YL265 

Parmly Billings Memorial Library – also 
called the Western Heritage Center 

2822 Montana Ave., Billings 10/26/1972 24YL756 

Pictograph Cave* 7 mi. SE of Billings in Indian Caves 
Park, Billings 

10/15/1966 24YL1 

Pompeys Pillar* W. of Pompey, Pompeys Pillar 10/15/1966 24YL176 

Prescott Commons Rimrock Rd., Billings, 04/30/1982 24YL264 

Ruth, Harold and Marion, Residence 111 Emerald Drive, Billings 06/21/2007 24YL1630 

US Post Office and Courthouse-Billings 2602 First Ave. N., Billings 03/14/1986 24YL754 

Yegen, Christian, House 208 S. 35th St., Billings 10/01/1979 24YL262 

Yegen, Peter, House 209 S. 35th St., Billings 04/16/1980 24YL266 

* designated as National Historic Landmarks by the National Park Service. 
Source:  State Historic Preservation Office, Montana Historical Society, 2008. 
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Remaining Historic Sites 
 
The range of types of historic structures in Yel-
lowstone County is varied.  All sites may not pos-
sess the characteristics required to qualify for the 
National Register of Historic Places, however, 
they may still be regarded as having historic or 
cultural value by the community.  
 
To date, the primary method by which informa-
tion is gathered on historic resources in the 
County has been through federally mandated sur-
veys, which occurs usually in areas of develop-
ment.   Underdeveloped areas of the County have 
received substantially less scientific investigation. 
 
RECOGNIZED HISTORIC SITES IN  
YELLOWSTONE COUNTY 
 
A number of the prehistoric and historic sites in 
Yellowstone County have been formally recog-
nized for their local, regional, and national sig-
nificance.  Of these tributes, placement on the 
National Park Service's National Register of His-
toric Places is perhaps the most important since 
selected sites must meet established criteria and 
receive a thorough evaluation of their historical 
value.   
 
There are 25 properties listed on the National 
Register of Historic Places in Yellowstone 
County.  Some sites may also be identified as 
meeting the minimum criteria used to determine 
eligibility for the National Register.  Several 
structures, two neighborhood districts and numer-
ous prehistoric and historic sites have been listed 
with the National Park Service as eligible for the 
National Register.  Sites listed on the National 
Register of Historic Places are shown in Table 1.  
 
The majority of historic sites in Yellowstone 
County have not received National Register des-
ignation.  The reason for this is that much of the 
survey work and research required for placement 
on the National Register has not been completed 
for potential sites.  More than 20 other sites in 
Yellowstone County have been recognized lo-
cally for their historic value. 
 
 

BILLINGS TOWNSITE HISTORIC DISTRICT 
 
In 1977, the Billings City Council passed an ordi-
nance creating the Billings Townsite Historic 
District and establishing the Historic Design Re-
view Board.  The purpose of the District is to re-
store and preserve a significant element of Bill-
ings’ history, as well as providing for “a mix of 
the old and the new”.  The District began as a 
four block area along Montana Avenue between 
North 26th Street and North 22nd Street.  The 
district now encompasses eight blocks between 
North 30th Street and North 22nd.  In recent 
years, the Historic District has gone through a 
major transformation with the restoration of the 
Billings Depot and the construction of new side-
walks, planters and pedestrian crosswalks.  Sev-
eral new businesses have located on Montana 
Avenue and many have expanded.  The property 
owners of the Historic District levied a special 
improvement assessment on themselves to pay 
for the public infrastructure improvements and 
leveraged these funds with Downtown Tax Incre-
ment District financing and federal grants.   
 
The District also imposed special sign standards 
that are administered by the City-County Plan-
ning Department and reviewed by the Montana 
Avenue sign review committee.  This district was 
expanded in 2006 to include the 2600 block of 
Montana Avenue.  

 
 
 
 
 
 

The Babcock Theater at 2nd Ave. North 
and Broadway (at right in photo) is the 
latest restoration project under way in the 
Downtown Historic District.  Renovation 
began in late 2008. 
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CULTURAL AMENITIES 
 
As the largest city in Montana and Wyoming, 
Billings has reached the population numbers that 
determine a city’s ability to build and support 
professional-quality, cultural institutions.  Busi-
nesses and professionals are attracted to culturally 
aware cities that provide quality of life amenities 
such as the arts and cultural entertainment.  These 
amenities should not be undervalued and cannot 
be overlooked in order to hold a position of re-
gional economic and civic leadership. 
    
The Billings Cultural Partners, an organization 
formed to preserve and promote Billings’ cultural 
resources, developed the Billings Cultural Plan in 
2002.  The plan outlines strategies to continue 
and expand cooperation among the individual 
arts, cultural and historic organization, improve 
access to the arts and culture, increase educa-
tional opportunities, strengthen the existing cul-
tural institutions and enhance Downtown.  The 
partners represent the major cultural, arts and his-
toric institutions in Billings.  Descriptions of 
these institutions taken from the Billings Cultural 
Partners website and are listed below: 
 
Alberta Bair Theatre: “The Alberta Bair Thea-
ter brings the excitement of every discipline in 
the performing arts to the Northern Rockies. With 
a 1,450 seating capacity, it attracts national and 
international renowned and culturally diverse en-
tertainment. The Theater also provides a home for 
local cultural and civic groups. The ABT usually 
has walk in tickets available.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Billings Depot: “This historic building was the 
center for railroad travel which opened the West 
for settlement. The Billings Depot compliments 
the spirit of revitalization within the Historic Dis-
trict. The Passenger Station Event Center accom-
modates conferences, receptions, public open 
house events, children’s theater and a variety of 
entertainment and community events. The "Horse 
of Course" benefit was hosted by the Depot with 
the funds dedicated to continued restoration”.  
2310 Montana Avenue. 
 
Billings Studio Theatre: “The largest commu-
nity theatre within 500 miles, the Billings Studio 
Theatre showcases local talent, staging, sets, 
equipment, and costumes. Pre-teens, teens, and 
adults participate in a dozen theater productions 
year-round. Volunteers from northern Wyoming 
and eastern Montana fill all acting and production 
roles at the theatre, which celebrated its fiftieth 
anniversary in 2000.”   1500 Rimrock Road. 
 
Billings Symphony Society:  Music Director 
Anne Harrigan and the musicians of the Billings 
Symphony Orchestra and Chorale invite you to 
join them for live symphonic music with interna-
tionally recognized guest artists. While most of 
their performances are at the Alberta Bair Thea-
ter, the Symphony performs in schools, offers 
workshops for students and celebrates Billings 
each year at Symphony in Pioneer Park.” 
 
Channel 7 – Public Access TV: “Channel 7 is a 
true friend to the community with its commitment 
to air community events and contribute to cultural 
awareness. Visit Channel 7’s website to get infor-
mation about programs and scheduling for the 
week.” 
 
Moss Mansion:  “Step into history with a one-
hour guided tour of the Moss Mansion Historic 
House Museum. The tour captures early turn-of-
the-century life as the Preston Boyd Moss family 
lived it. Visitors see original draperies, fixtures, 
furniture, Persian carpets and artifacts displayed 
in the 1903 red sandstone structure.”  914 Divi-
sion Street. 
 
 

Alberta Bair Theater at 2801 3rd Ave. North 
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MetraPark:  “MetraPark, a public facility lo-
cated in Billings, Montana, is an enterprise of 
Yellowstone County, Montana. MetraPark con-
sists of a substantial acreage along the Yellow-
stone River. The site is located in the Billings city 
limits, is within sight of the interstate highway, 
one mile from downtown, and one and one half 
miles from Logan International Airport.”   
 
“The facility offers a 10,000 seat arena, 6,500 
seat grandstand, two major heated and air condi-
tioned exhibit buildings, a half mile track used for 
both horse racing and motor sports, and an assort-
ment of horse barns and smaller buildings. Land-
scaped parks and paved, lighted parking comprise 
the rest of the site.”  308 6th Ave. N.  
 
Peter Yegen Junior Yellowstone County Mu-
seum: “The Peter Yegen Jr. Yellowstone County 
Museum is located on the Rims by Logan Inter-
national Airport. It contains over 5,000 objects 
from the Yellowstone Valley, including a large 
collection of Native American artifacts and a 
Lewis and Clark Fur Trading Post exhibit. There 
is a gift shop and changing contemporary exhib-
its. The museum is open throughout the entire 
year and free to the public.”  1950 Terminal Cir-
cle. 
Rimrock Opera Company: “The Rimrock Op-
era Company enhances cultural life in Billings 
and the surrounding areas with their excellent 
productions. It is their goal to make opera avail-

able to everyone through community outreach 
and educational programs.” 
 
Venture Theatre: “With its stage in a defunct 
automotive repair garage, Venture Theatre is true 
community theatre.  Venture performs multiple 
productions of six plays, children’s theatre and 
teaches grade school and high school classes.”  
1410 Central Avenue. 
  
Western Heritage Center:  “The Western Heri-
tage Center features interactive exhibits exploring 
“Our Place in the West.” It is located in the his-
toric Parmly Billings Library. The Center is open 
year round and is free of charge. The Center also 
offers historic site interpretation through its 
“Museum Without Walls” program.”  2822 Mon-
tana Avenue. 
 

 
 
 

 
Yellowstone Art Museum: “Contemporary and 
historic work from nationally and internationally 
acclaimed artists are featured in changing exhibi-
tions at the largest and most comprehensive art 
museum in Montana. A first-class Montana col-
lection showcases Russell Chatham, Deborah 
Butterfield and more. View the largest public col-
lection of cowboy artist and writer Will James.”  
Visit the YAM at 401 North 27th Street.  

The Western Heritage Center found at 
2822 Montana Ave. is situated in the  
original Parmly Billings Library building. 

The Moss Mansion at 914 Division St. 
dates to 1903 
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Yellowstone Public Radio: “Montana’s public 
broadcasting station at 91.7 in Billings Montana. 
It is a culturally rich station with public arts and 
community events broadcast daily.” 
 
ZooMontana: “A walk on the Wild Side?   Visit 
ZooMontana, where you'll see a diversity of wild 
animals from Montana and many other countries. 
The zoo features northern temperate climate spe-
cies, and is a wonderful new home for Siberian 
Tigers, North American River Otters, Sika Deer, 
Eastern Grey Wolf, Great Horned Owls and 
Lesser Spot-Nosed Guenon.”   
 
ZooMontana recently completed a new 2-acre 
exhibit called Bear Meadow.  This attraction cur-
rently houses Bruno the brown bear. ZooMontana 
is located at 2100 South Shiloh Road.  
 

Bruno the Grizzly Bear was added to the 
ZooMontana Exhibit in 2007, and has be-
come a popular source of entertainment.   
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4.10 COMMUNITY HEALTH 
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
In 2006, the Alliance, an affiliated partnership 
consisting of Billings Clinic, St. Vincent Health-
care, and RiverStone Health, sponsored a com-
prehensive Community Health Assessment 
(CHA).  The CHA used national (Healthy Peo-
ple 2010) and state benchmarks to identify op-
portunities for community health improvement.  
The CHA was conducted by Professional Re-
source Consultants, Inc.  The Community Health 
Survey developed for this assessment gave a 
remarkably complete and accurate view of the 
health status of Yellowstone County residents 
through a randomized telephone survey of the 
health and behaviors of 400 community mem-
bers.  The sample drawn for this survey was rep-
resentative of the Yellowstone County popula-
tion in terms of socioeconomic characteristics 
and geographical location.  Existing vital statis-
tics and other health related data were also incor-
porated into this assessment for Yellowstone 
County.  To further gain perspective from com-
munity members, five focus groups were con-
ducted in Yellowstone County, including groups 
among: community leaders; social service pro-
viders; physicians and health professionals; em-
ployers; and educators and public service profes-
sionals.   
 
The Community Health Assessment provides 
information for consideration when developing 
effective interventions. This information ensures 
the issues of greatest concern for Yellowstone 
County are identified and considered when deci-
sion to commit resources are made, thereby 
making the greatest possible impact on the status 
of the community’s health.  The 2006 CHA 
serves as a tool toward reaching three basic 
goals: 
 
• To improve residents’ health status, increase 

their life spans, and elevate their overall 
quality of life.  A health community is not 
only one where its residents suffer little from 
physical and mental illness, but also one 
where its residents enjoy a high quality of 
life. 

• To reduce the health disparities among resi-
dents.  By gathering demographic informa-
tion along with health status and behavior 
data, it is possible to identify population seg-
ments that are most at-risk for various dis-
eases and injuries.  Intervention plans aimed 
at targeting these individuals may then be 
developed to combat some of the socio-
economic factors which have historically 
had a negative impact on residents’ health. 

• To increase accessibility to preventive ser-
vices for all community residents.  More 
accessible preventive services will prove 
beneficial in accomplishing the first goal 
(improving health status, increasing life 
spans, and elevating the quality of life), as 
well as lowering the costs associated with 
caring for late-stage diseases resulting from 
a lack of preventive care. 

 
While no single health issue emerged as critical, 
the CHA identified mental health, unintentional 
injury, heart disease, physical activity, and nutri-
tion as areas that warranted improvement.  From 
this data, significant opportunities for health im-
provement exist in Yellowstone County with 
regard to the aforementioned health areas.  
These areas of concern have been presented in 
no particular order, and are subject to the discre-
tion of the area providers, the steering commit-
tee, or other local organizations and community 
leaders as to actionability and priority.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Healthy People 2010 is a program estab-
lished by the U.S. Department of Health 
and Human Services to identify the most 
significant preventable threats to health, 
and establish national goals to reduce 
these threats.  The local health community 
has used these guidelines in preparing the 
following Community Health Assessment. 
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MENTAL HEALTH 
 
Mental health is a state of successful perform-
ance of mental function, resulting in productive 
activities, and fulfilling relationships with other 
people.  Mental health is indispensible to per-
sonal well-being, family and interpersonal rela-
tionships, and contributions to community and 
society. Mental disorders are health conditions 
that are characterized by alterations in thinking, 
mood, or behavior (or some combination 
thereof) which are associated with distress and/
or impaired functioning that spawn a host of hu-
man problems that may include disability, pain, 
or death.  Mental illness is the term that refers 
collectively to all mental disorders.   Mental dis-
orders generate an immense public health burden 
of disability.  In established market economies 
such as the United States, mental illness is on 
par with heart disease and cancer as a cause of 
disability.  Suicide, a major public health prob-
lem in the United States—occurs most fre-
quently as a consequence of a mental disorder.  
 
The majority of Yellowstone County adults 
(66.3%) rate their overall mental health as 
“excellent” or “very good.”  However, 6.9% of 
Yellowstone County adults believe that their 
overall mental health is “fair” or “poor.”  Yel-
lowstone County results more favorable than 
national findings that state 11.7% of adults be-
lieve that their overall mental health is “fair” or 
“poor.” 
 
Women are more likely than men to report “fair” 
or “poor” mental health status.  Across Yellow-

stone County, 12.4% of adults report that they 
have been diagnosed with major depression by a 
physician at some point in their lives.  This is 
slightly higher than national findings (9.1%). 
 
Key demographic characteristics of Yellowstone 
County note the following: 
 
• Women report a higher prevalence of major 

depression than do men. 
• Adults aged 18 to 64 more often report a 

diagnosis of major depression than do older 
adults. 

• Low-income adults report a much higher 
prevalence of diagnosed major depression. 

Nearly one out of four Yellowstone County 
adults (25.7%) report that they have had two or 
more years in their lives when they felt de-
pressed or sad on most days, although they may 
have felt okay sometimes.  This represents 
roughly 25,757 adults in Yellowstone County 
who have faced or are facing prolonged bouts 
with depression.  This is similar to the national 
report of 24.9%.   
 
Community health panelists in Yellowstone 
County discussed the mental health of the resi-
dents in the community.  One major concern 
expressed by panelists was the lack of mental 
health education as it pertains to prevention and 
care.  Panelists are concerned that community 
residents don’t seek mental healthcare until it is 
a crisis situation.  Community members, one 
panelist feels, do not feel as comfortable as they 
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should seeking out help early in an illness.  Fur-
ther education for the support of mental health 
problems could help individuals seek the help 
they need before their illness progresses.  One 
panelist suggested the high prevalence of mental 
illness in the area may be due to the fact that the 
community has more mental health services than 
surrounding communities.  Among Yellowstone 
County respondents reporting major or chronic 
depression, 59.5% acknowledge that they have 
sought professional help for a mental or emo-
tional problem.   
 
UNINTENTIONAL INJURIES 
 
The risk of injury is so great that most persons 
sustain a significant injury at some time during 
their lives.  Nevertheless, this widespread human 
damage too often is taken for granted, in the er-
roneous belief that injuries happen by chance 
and are the result of unpreventable “accidents.”  
In fact, many injuries are not “accidents” or ran-
dom, uncontrollable acts of fate; rather, most 
injuries are predictable and preventable.  For 
ages 1 through 44 years, [United States] deaths 
from injuries far surpass those from cancer—the 
overall leading natural cause of death at these 
ages—by about three to one.  
 
 

 
 
 
 

Motor vehicle crashes account for nearly one-
half of all accidental deaths in Yellowstone 
County.  Between 2000 and 2002, the annual 
average age-adjusted unintentional injury death 
rate in Yellowstone County was 40.7 per 
100,000 population.  This is lower than the Mon-
tana rate for the same period (53.0%); however, 
it is higher than the rate reported for the United 
States (35.8%).   
 
Motor Vehicle Accidents 
 
Over the past several years, the Yellowstone 
County age-adjusted motor vehicle accident 
death rate has trended upward.  Between 2000 
and 2002, the annual average age-adjusted motor 
vehicle accident death rate in Yellowstone 
County was 17.8 per 100,000 populations.  This 
is lower than the Montana rate of 25.5 for the 
same period and higher than the United States’ 
rate of 15.5.   
 
Seat Belt Use 
 
76.8% of Yellowstone County adults report 
“always” wearing a seat belt when driving or 
riding in an automobile.  This is statistically 
similar to national findings (78.3%); both fail to 
satisfy the Healthy People 2010 target (92% or 
higher).  In Yellowstone County, men are much 
less likely to report “always” wearing a seat belt 
than are women.  There is a strong positive cor-
relation of seat belt use with age in Yellowstone 
County.  Only three-fourths of adults under age 
65 “always” wear a seat belt, compared to 86.0% 
of those aged 65 and older. Lower-income re-
spondents are much more likely to report consis-
tent seat belt use than middle to high-income 
respondents. 
 
89.3% of Yellowstone County parents of young 
children report that their child “always” wears 
an appropriate child restraint (e.g., safety seat or 
seat belt) when riding in an automobile.  This is 
more favorable than national findings (81.3%). 
 
 
 
 

Leading Causes of Unintentional 
Injury Deaths (Yellowstone 

County, 2001-2003)
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Bicycle Helmet Usage 
 
36.2 % of Yellowstone County parents of chil-
dren aged 5 to 17 report that their child “always” 
wears a helmet when riding a bicycle.  This is 
statistically similar to national findings (28.8%).   
 

Firearms 
 
53.5% of Yellowstone County adults have a fire-
arm kept in or around their home.  This is statis-
tically much higher than the national rate of 
34.1%.   
55.0% of Yellowstone County households with 

children have a firearm in or around the home.  
Reports of firearms in or around the home are 
more prevalent among men, especially those in 
middle-to-high-income households.   
 
Among Yellowstone County households with 
firearms, 9.9% report that there is at least one 
weapon that is kept unlocked and loaded.  This 
is statistically similar to national findings that 
report 7.6%. 
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Violence 
 
Violence claims the lives of many of the Na-
tion’s young persons and threatens the health 
and well-being of persons of all ages in the 
United States.  Violent crime rates in Yellow-
stone County appear to be increasing during the 
period between 1994 and 2003.  4.0% of Yel-
lowstone County adults report that they have 
been the victim of a violent crime in the area in 
the past five years.  This is less favorable than 
national findings (1.5%).  In Yellowstone 
County: 
 
• Women much more often report experienc-

ing violent crime than do men. 
• Adults under age 65 much more often report 

experiencing violent crime than older adults. 
 
Family Violence 
 
3.2 % of Yellowstone County adults acknowl-
edge being the victim of domestic violence in 
the past five years.  This is statistically similar to 
national findings that report 2.7%.  In Yellow-
stone County, reports of domestic violence are 
greater among adults under the age of 65 years 
as well as person in the low-income category.   
 
HEART DISEASE 
 
Heart disease and stroke—the principal compo-
nents of cardiovascular disease—are the first and 
third leading cause of death in the United States 
respectively, accounting for more than 40% of 
all deaths.   
 
• About 950,000 Americans die of heart dis-

ease or stroke each year, which amounts to 
one death every 33 seconds. 

• Although heart disease and stroke are often 
thought to affect men and older people pri-
marily, it is also a major killer of women 
and people in the prime of life.  More than 
half of those who die of heart disease or 
stoke each year are women. 

• Each year, about 63 of every 100,000 deaths 
are due to stroke. 

Looking at only deaths due to heart disease or 
stroke, however, understates the health effects of 
these two conditions: 
 
• About 61 million American (almost one-

fourth of the population) live with the effects 
of stroke or heart disease. 

• Heart disease is leading cause of disability 
among working adults. 

• Stroke alone accounts for the disability of 
more than 1 million Americans. 

• Almost 6 million hospitalizations each year 
are due to heart disease or stroke. 

• About 4.5 million stroke survivors are alive 
today. 

 
The economic effects of heart disease and stroke 
on the U.S. healthcare system grow larger as the 
population ages.  In 2001, the nationwide cost 
for heart disease was $105 billion; for stroke, 
$28 billion.  Lost productivity due to stroke and 
heart disease cost more than $129 billion.  
 
5.1% of Yellowstone County adults report that 
they suffer from or have been diagnosed with 
heart disease, such as coronary heart disease, 
angina, or heart attack.  This represents approxi-
mately 5,100 adults in Yellowstone County.  
This report is more favorable than national find-
ings (8.2%).   
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3.3% of Yellowstone County adults report that 
they suffer from or have been diagnosed with 
cerebrovascular disease (a stroke).  These find-
ings are slightly higher than statewide findings 
(1.8%) as well as nationwide findings (2.4%). 
 
Hypertension (High Blood Pressure) 
 
High blood pressure is known as the “silent kil-
ler” and remains a major risk factor for coronary 
heart disease, stroke, and heart failure.  About 50 
million adults in the United States have high 
blood pressure.  
 
94.6% of adults in Yellowstone County have had 
their blood pressure tested within the past two 
years. This is identical to national findings, and 
very close to the Healthy People 2010 target of 
95%.  26.1% of Yellowstone County adults have 
been told at some point that their blood pressure 
was high; an additional 2.1% have not been 
tested in the past five years.  The prevalence of 
high blood pressure in Yellowstone County is 
less favorable than Montana findings (21.3%) 
and more favorable than national findings 
(34.2%).  Nearly nine out of 10 Yellowstone 
County adults (88.9%) who have been told that 
their blood pressure was high report that they are 
currently taking actions (medication, diet, and/or 
exercise) to control their condition.   
 
High Blood Cholesterol 
 
High blood cholesterol is a major risk factor for 
coronary heart disease that can be modified.  
More than 50 million United States adults have 
blood cholesterol levels that require medical ad-
vice and treatment.  More than 90 million adults 
have cholesterol levels that are higher than desir-
able.  Experts recommend that all adults aged 20 
years and older have their cholesterol checked at 
least once every 5 years to help them take action 
to prevent or lower their risk of coronary heart 
disease.  Lifestyle changes that prevent or lower 
high cholesterol include eating a diet low in 
saturated fat and cholesterol, increasing physical 
activity, and reducing excess weight.  
 
 

77.7% of Yellowstone County adults have had 
their blood cholesterol checked within the past 
five years.  This is more favorable than Montana 
findings (70.1%) and less favorable than na-
tional findings (86.6%). 

 
28.5% of Yellowstone County adults have been 
told by a health professional that their choles-
terol level was high.  This is similar to both the 
statewide (29.8%) and national findings 
(32.9%).  In addition, 26.1% of Yellowstone 
County adults who have been told that their cho-
lesterol level was high have not had their choles-
terol checked in the last five years. Further, 
nearly 35% of low income respondents and close 
to 45% of young adults have not been tested in 
the past five years. 
 
Nine out of 10 Yellowstone County adults 
(83.6%) who have been told that their blood 
cholesterol was high report that they are cur-
rently taking actions to control their condition, 
such as through medication, diet, and/or exer-
cise.  
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Total Heart Disease Risk Factors 
 
Individual level risk factors which put people at 
risk for cardiovascular diseases include: 
 
• High Blood Pressure 
• High Blood Cholesterol 
• Tobacco Use 
• Physical Inactivity 
• Poor Nutrition 
• Overweight/Obesity 
• Diabetes  
 
Nine out of 10 Yellowstone County adults 
(89.1%) report having one or more cardiovascu-
lar risk factors.  Yellowstone County demo-
graphics show that men more often present one 
or more cardiovascular risk factors than do 
women, adults aged 65 and older are at a much 
greater risk than young adults, and lower-income 
adults more often report one-or more cardiovas-
cular risk factors.   
 
Three health-related behaviors contribute dis-
tinctly to cardiovascular disease: 
 
• Poor Nutrition: People who have poor nutri-

tion are more likely to be overweight; people 
who are overweight have a higher risk for 
cardiovascular disease.  Almost 60% of 
United States adults are overweight or 
obese. 

• Lack of Physical Activity: People who are 
not physically active have twice the risk for 
heart disease of those who are active.  More 
than half of United States adults do no 
achieve recommended levels of physical 
activity. 

• Tobacco Use: Smokers have twice the risk 
for heart attack of nonsmokers.  Nearly one-
fifth of all deaths from cardiovascular dis-
ease, or about 190,000 deaths a year nation-
ally, are smoking related.  

 
 

PHYSICAL ACTIVITY 
 
Research has demonstrated that virtually all indi-
viduals will benefit from regular physical activ-
ity.  A Surgeon General’s report on physical ac-
tivity and health concluded that moderate physi-
cal activity can substantially reduce the risk of 
developing or dying from heart disease, diabetes, 
colon cancer, and high blood pressure.  Physical 
activity also may protect against lower back pain 
and some forms of cancer.  On average, physi-
cally active people outlive those who are inac-
tive.  Regular physical activity also helps to 
maintain the functional independence of older 
adults and enhanced the quality of life for people 
of all ages.  
 
26.3% of Yellowstone County adults report no 
leisure-time physical activity in the past month. 
This report is significantly less favorable than 
Montana findings (18.8%).  There is a strong 
negative correlation with income in Yellowstone 
County—persons living at low income levels 
more often report not getting any physical activ-
ity( 37.5%) in their leisure time in the past 
month than do middle to high income persons 
(21.9%). 
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In the United States, poor diet and physical inac-
tivity lead to 300,000 deaths each year—second 
only to tobacco.  People who are overweight or 
obese increase their risk for heart disease, diabe-
tes, high blood pressure, arthritis-related dis-
abilities, and some cancers. Not getting an ade-
quate amount of exercise is associated with 
needing more medication, visiting a physician 
more often, and being hospitalized more often.  
The direct medical cost associated with physical 
inactivity was $29 billion in 1987 and nearly 
$76.6 billion in 2000.  The annual cost of obe-
sity is the United States is about $100 billion.   
 
Adults should strive to meet either of the follow-
ing physical activity recommendations: 
 
• Moderate-intensity physical activities for at 

least 30 minutes on five or more days of the 
week, or 

• Vigorous-intensity physical activity three or 
more days per week for 20 or more minutes 
per occasion.  

 
In Yellowstone County, less than half of adults 
(41.4%) participate in regular, sustained moder-
ate or vigorous physical activity.  This data is 
less favorable than national findings (47.2%).   

 
Adults aged 40 to 64 and adults living at lower 
income levels are the two demographic groups 
in Yellowstone County least likely to meet the 
physical activity recommendations.   
 

36.8% of Yellowstone County adults report that 
their physician has asked about or given advice 
to them about physical activity in the past year.  
Nearly one-fourth of Yellowstone County com-
munity members participate in a regular fitness 
program or center.  Most (76.4%), however, do 
not.  Of those not participating, 22.9% cite not 
having enough time to exercise and 21.4% cite 
the expense of the programs/centers as reasons 
why they don’t regularly participate in a fitness 
program or center.  Nearly all of Yellowstone 
County area residents are aware of exercise and 
fitness opportunities available in the area 
(93.5%).  When asked what could be done in the 
community to help them exercise more fre-
quently one in ten Yellowstone County respon-
dents mentioned that more convenient exercise 
facilities would help them to exercise more fre-
quently.  Other less mentioned attributes that 
would help respondents exercise more fre-
quently include more walking trails and more 
convenient biking trails, free or subsidized exer-
cise programs, and lower costs.  
 
Sedentary Activities for Children 
 
Only 7.4% of Yellowstone County parents re-
port that their child does not watch any televi-
sion on a typical school day; and 17.6% indicate 
that their child watches three or more hours of 
television per typical school day.  

A total of 18.3% of Yellowstone County parents 
indicate that their child plays video games, uses 
the computer, or uses the Internet for two or 
more hours in a typical school day.  

Source: 2005 PRC Community Health Survey, Profes-
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Source: 2005 PRC Community Health Survey, Professional 
Research Consultants. 
 

NUTRITION 
 
The benefits of good nutrition are multiple. Be-
sides helping you maintain a healthy weight, 
good nutrition is essential for the body and all of 
its systems to function optimally for a lifetime. 
In fact, the benefits of good nutrition can be 
found in physical and mental health because a 
healthy diet provides energy, promotes good 
sleep, and gives the body what it needs to stay 
healthy.  
 
The U.S. Department Agriculture recommends 
that Americans consume at least five servings of 
fruit and vegetables per day.  A slim 34.9% of 
Yellowstone County adults report eating five or 
more servings of fruits and/or vegetables per 
day.  Survey respondents less likely to consume 
five or more fruits/vegetables per day are men 
and adults aged 18 to 39.  The following charts 
further examine fruit/vegetable consumption by 
various demographic characteristics. 

 
U.S. Department of Agriculture guidelines en-
courage the consumption of two to three dairy 
servings per day. One-fourth of Yellowstone 
County adults report eating three or more serv-
ings of dairy per day; a total of 10% report eat-
ing zero servings of dairy per day. 
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PLANNING FOR COMMUNITY HEALTH  
 
The preceding data gives an overall glance of the 
health status of Yellowstone County residents.  
There is a reasonable relationship between the 
built environment and health.  Perhaps the most 
easily understood link relates to the occurrence 
of overweight and obesity.  The built environ-
ment affects weight management by affecting 
both food intake and energy expenditure through   
physical activity.  The built environment may 
also play a role in controlling weight by shaping 
food access and availability.   
 

 
Our built environment can contribute to individ-
ual mental health as well as population-wide 
well-being.  
 
In addition, the built environment affects vehicle 
usage; with more driving comes more vehicle 
crashes as well as pedestrian injuries and fatali-
ties.  Moreover, increased vehicle usage contrib-
utes to overall releases of air pollutants which 
are associated with numerous adverse health 
outcomes. 
 

As we begin to recognize and understand the 
health consequences associated with the built 
environment, we can begin to design effective 
and coordinated regional planning.  Many of the 
health related benefits that could flow from the 
“smart growth” approach—less air pollution, 
increased access to nutritious foods, more physi-
cal activity, fewer motor vehicle crashes—would 
also yield economic benefits, such as less emer-
gency room visits and more marketable commu-
nities.  
 

The Annual “Trail Trek” is a community event 
aimed at bringing citizens together to celebrate 
the Heritage Trail system, physical activity and 
community well-being.  
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CHAPTER 5.0 IMPLEMENTATION  
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
The five subchapters in this chapter provide 
detailed guidelines for implementing the goals and 
objectives listed in Chapter 3.  Each subchapter 
outlines a proposed or existing approach to the 
subjects mandated by the Montana Growth Policy 
statutes, 76-1-601 et seq., MCA.  These subjects 
include: 

“A description of policies, regulations, and other 
measures to be implemented in order to achieve the 
goals and objectives…” (76-1-601(d), MCA).  The 
implementation strategies are contained in 
Subchapter 5.1. 

“A strategy for development, maintenance, and 
replacement of public infrastructure, including 
drinking water systems, wastewater treatment 
facilities, sewer systems, solid waste facilities, fire 
protection facilities, roads, and bridges” (76-1-601
(e), MCA).  The City and County capital 
improvements strategies are described in 
Subchapter 5.2. 

“An implementation strategy that includes a 
timetable for implementing the growth policy, a list 

of conditions that will lead to a revision of the 
growth policy, and a timetable for reviewing the 
growth policy at least once every five years and 
revising the policy if necessary” (76-1-601(f), 
MCA). Subchapter 5.3 presents a timeline for 
implementing and evaluating the growth policy and 
lists conditions that may lead to a revision. 

“A statement of how the governing bodies will 
coordinate and cooperate with other jurisdictions … 
on matters related to the growth policy” (76-1-601
(g).  Subchapter 5.4 discusses how the governing 
bodies of Yellowstone County and the City of 
Billings will coordinate and cooperate on matters 
related to the growth policy. 

A statement explaining how the governing bodies 
will define, evaluate, and make decisions regarding 
proposed subdivisions with respect to the criteria 
listed in 76-3-608(3)(a), MCA [the subdivision 
review criteria] as required by 76-1-601(h), MCA.  
The definition and evaluation criteria are presented 
in Subchapter 5.5 along with “a statement 
explaining how public hearings regarding proposed 
subdivisions will be conducted” (76-1-601(i), 
MCA). 

 



Page 198 

Chapter 5.1:  Implementation Tools and Strategies 

CHAPTER 5.1 IMPLEMENTATION 
TOOLS AND STRATEGIES 
 

INTRODUCTION 
 
The tools available to implement a Growth 
Policy are limited by legal authority, by 
administrative cost, and to some degree, political 
acceptance.  Implementation tools may be 
enforced through regulations, adopted as policy 
by governing bodies or emplaced voluntarily by 
landowners.  They may be mandated by state 
law or authorized by City Code or County 
Ordinances.  Some tools are simply policies, 
without the force and effect of law, while others 
are purely educational.  There is a wide variety 
of tools currently used in Yellowstone County 
and the City of Billings.  The first part of 
Section 5.1 briefly describes the existing and 
recommended implementation tools available to 
the City and County to achieve the Goals and 
Objectives of this Growth Policy.   How these 
tools are to be applied is described in the second 
part of this section under Implementation 
Strategies.  This section is a critical part of the 
Yellowstone County Growth Policy in that it 
specifies the actions recommended to achieve 
the Goals and Objectives listed in Chapter 3. 

IMPLEMENTATION TOOLS 
 
This section provides general information on a 
range of planning tools that can be used to 
implement a growth policy.  It includes brief 
definitions or descriptions for each tool.  Some 
tools are already in use in Billings and 
Yellowstone County and others are suggested 
for further consideration.  This list is not 
intended to be comprehensive of all planning 
tools available to local jurisdictions. 

The implementation tools are organized into the 
following descriptive categories:  Regulatory, 
Planning and Programming, Financial, 
Educational, and Cooperative.  Regulatory tools 
are enforced by regulations and are authorized 
by state statute.  Governing bodies adopt 
Planning and Programming tools to demonstrate 

a commitment to a particular direction or course 
of action, and can be employed with discretion.  
Financial tools require a financial commitment 
to appropriate funds for specific projects.  
Educational tools include a broad range of items 
used to inform governing bodies, policy makers, 
and the public on key planning and community 
development issues.  Cooperative tools describe 
partnerships between departments and agencies 
to develop joint policies or action plans. These 
may serve as the basis for creating, reviewing, 
and revising policies and regulations.  
Cooperative tools are generally enforced or 
administered at the discretion of cooperating 
agencies. 

Regulatory Tools  

Subdivision Regulations 

Counties and incorporated municipalities must 
adopt subdivision regulations that comply with 
the Montana Subdivision and Platting Act (76-3-
101 et seq., MCA).  Subdivision regulations 
control the creation of new parcels by imposing 
design and infrastructure standards and by 
establishing procedures for local governmental 
and public review.  Regulating the division of 
land ensures that development can be adequately 
served without adversely impacting public 
services and natural resources.   

Both the City and County have adopted 
subdivision regulations.  Section 5.5 provides 
more detailed information on the relationship 
between subdivision regulations and this Growth 
Policy.  Subdivision regulations are among the 
most effective tools available for 
implementation of a growth policy, particularly 
in areas of the County where zoning, building 
permits, and other tools may be unavailable and/
or infeasible. 

Design Standards 

Design standards are typically part of 
subdivision regulations or incorporated into the 
municipal code to preserve community 
character, protect property values, and ensure 
public safety.  The Montana Subdivision and 
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Platting Act authorizes the adoption of design 
standards, and self-chartered municipalities may 
include them in their municipal code. 

 Design standards can significantly affect the 
appearance and functionality of a development.  
For these reasons, they are often employed to 
address a variety of issues including land use, 
aesthetics, transportation, and public service. 
Flexible design standards may help reduce costs 
to the developer.  Development costs can also 
increase if design standards are complex and 
rigid.  Both the City and the County have 
adopted the Entryway/Interchange zoning 
regulations, which require a higher level of 
landscaping and building design in the 
Entryway/Interchange zoning districts.  
Additional design standards have been adopted 
by the City for the Zoo Drive-Shiloh Road 
Corridor as zoning ‘overlay districts’. These 
districts are at major entryways into the 
community and are intended to be developed in 
an attractive and appealing manner.   

Zoning Regulations 

Zoning is another commonly used tool for 
implementing land use policy.  The historical 
rationale for zoning was to separate 
incompatible land uses.  Zoning ordinances 
generally address type of use, intensity of use, 
and space and bulk requirements.  Development 
and design standards for such things as signage, 
parking, landscaping, noise, lighting, buildings, 
and site layout can also be addressed through 
zoning regulations.  A zoning map and the 
descriptive text of districts are the two critical 
components of zoning regulations.  Municipal or 
County zoning must comply with the Growth 
Policy and its amendments. 

The Billings-Yellowstone County Unified 
Zoning Regulations govern zoning in the City 
and County.  Most of the County is not zoned.   
Billings, Laurel, and Broadview all maintain 
their own zoning within their corporate 
boundaries.  Laurel has extraterritorial zoning 
jurisdiction that extends approximately one mile 
outside of the city limits.  Yellowstone County 

has a zoning jurisdiction that extends out from 
the Billings city limits approximately 4-1/2 
miles.  The majority of the zoned property 
within Yellowstone County is located in and 
around the Billings and Laurel urban areas.  
Additionally, there are a number of citizen-
initiated zoning districts located throughout the 
County as described in the Land Use Element 
chapter.   

The City of Billings Zoning Ordinance #1099, 
originally adopted on July 15, 1930, governs 
zoning within the municipal limits of the City of 
Billings.  Yellowstone County adopted a zoning 
jurisdiction and regulations by Resolution 
#34723 on November 6, 1973.    

In addition to the more traditional form of 
zoning, jurisdictions may explore other zoning 
approaches that can be used to regulate 
development of property.  Some of these 
alternatives are described below. 

Citizen Initiated Zoning 

The County Commissioners are authorized to 
create a planning and zoning district for an area 
at the request of at least 60 percent of the 
landowners (76-2-101 et seq., MCA).  The area 
of the district must be over 40 acres and must 
not have been previously zoned.  This type of 
zoning, conventionally referred to as “citizen-
initiated”, allows landowners to plan for and 
zone an area based on their land use preferences. 
In Yellowstone County, there are five citizen-
initiated or “Special Zoning Districts” 
administered by the Planning and Zoning 
Commission.  The Commission consists of the 
Board of County Commissioners, the County 
Surveyor and the County Clerk and Recorder.  It 
is the responsibility of this Commission to 
prepare and adopt a development pattern for the 
physical and economic development of the 
district.  In practice, the development pattern, 
which resembles a land use plan, is usually 
prepared by the landowners.  The Commission 
may adopt zoning or other land use regulations 
to implement the development pattern.  As a 
practicality, the City-County Planning 
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Department takes over the responsibility to 
administer the districts’ zoning regulations. 

Performance Zoning 

Performance zoning is an alternative to 
traditional “Euclidian” zoning because it uses 
measurable standards to regulate the impact a 
land use may have on its surroundings instead of 
separating uses by zoning districts.  Performance 
zoning for residential uses can be used to protect 
natural resources and provide flexibility in the 
development design.  Common performance 
thresholds established through performance 
zoning include minimum amount open space, 
maximum density, and maximum percent of 
impervious surface.   

Performance zoning has also been used to 
address commercial and industrial uses by 
requiring more intense uses to meet higher 
standards for site and building design.  For 
example, the City has adopted the Medical 
Corridor Permit Zoning District.  In this district, 
a proposal is evaluated for compliance with 
absolute standards and a point system is used to 
determine compliance against a set of relative 
standards.  All projects have to meet the absolute 
standards; then, the more intense the use, the 
greater the number of relative standards must be 
met. 

Interim Zoning 

Interim zoning may be employed by the City or 
County as an emergency measure to protect the 
public health, safety and under the County’s 
authority, morals (76-2-206 and 76-2-306, 
MCA).  A jurisdiction may use interim zoning to 
prohibit uses that may conflict with a 
“contemplated zoning proposal” which the 
governing body is considering.  The interim 
zoning in the County may be effective for one 
year, but the City can implement it initially for 
only six months, with an extension up to one 
year.  Interim zoning has been used by the City 
of Billings and Yellowstone County to 
implement the Entryway/Interchange zoning 
regulations until permanent regulations could be 

adopted and more recently to implement 
buffering standards for sexually oriented 
businesses. 

Transfer of Development Rights 

Transfer of Development Rights (TDR) uses 
zoning to allow owners of land in areas called 
“sending districts” to sever the development 
rights from their property and sell, or otherwise 
legally transfer those rights to owners of 
property located in specified “receiving 
districts”, where higher intensity of development 
is preferred.  There are several components 
essential to a TDR program:  a designated 
protection/preservation area (sending zone), a 
designated growth area (receiving zone), 
development rights that can be severed from the 
land, and a procedure for transferring 
development rights between properties.  TDR 
procedures have not been established in 
Yellowstone County. 

Building Permits 

The City Building Division administers building 
codes for the City of Billings only.  In 2003, 
state legislative changes took away the authority 
of the City Building Division to review building 
permits outside the City Limits. .  Previous to 
that, the City Building Division  had 
administered the County’s building permit 
jurisdiction which was generally a 4.5 mile 
jurisdiction surrounding the City and within the 
Unified Zoning Jurisdiction. Now, permitting of 
building construction in the County falls under 
the Montana Building Codes Division at the 
State.  The Building Codes that are adopted by 
the State, including building, plumbing, 
mechanical, and electrical, are also required to 
be adopted by the City.  The Code provides the 
City with minimum standards to safeguard life 
and property by regulating building construction.  
They also serve to create an enjoyable and 
aesthetically pleasing place to live while 
preserving property values.  A building permit is 
required for almost any type of construction on 
private property.  Several Departments are 
involved in the review process, including Fire, 
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Engineering, Planning and Community Services 
and Public Utilities to ensure compliance with 
their associated codes.   

Floodplain Regulations 

The purpose of floodplain regulations is to 
protect the watercourses and their flood storage 
areas, as well as the public health, safety, and 
welfare.  Montana state law requires local 
governments to adopt and enforce floodplain 
management regulations. The City and the 
County administer separate floodplain 
regulations. 

Planning and Programming Tools 

Long-Range Planning 

Critical implementation tools for this Growth 
Policy are more detailed neighborhood or area 
plans, and plans to address a particular issue 
such as transportation, parks and recreation, 
economic development, infrastructure or 
housing.  This Growth Policy establishes a 
framework for future plans by specifying public 
values through Goals and Objectives.  With the 
adoption of this Growth Policy, plans may be 
developed that provide a higher level of detail 
and include content specific to an area or issue.  
Since 2003, five neighborhood plans within the 
City and three community plans within the 
County have been written and adopted as part of 
this Growth Policy.  More information on those 
plans can be found in Chapter 4. 

In addition to the development of new plans, 
existing plans which presently have a role in 
decision making may need to be revised and 
updated.  These include the 2005 Urban Area 
Transportation Plan, 2004 Heritage Trail Plan, 
Parks2020, and several neighborhood plans.  
Updates to these plans could be simple additions 
or modifications or may require a new approach 
to become more consistent with the Growth 
Policy Goals and Objectives. 

 

 

Annexation Policy 

A city expands its boundaries and its 
jurisdictional authority through the process of 
annexation.  State statute authorizes six separate 
methods for annexation.  Adjacent land may be 
annexed as described in Parts 42 through 44 of 
Title 7, Chapter 2, Montana Code Annotated 
(MCA).  Property that is wholly surrounded by a 
city may be annexed under Part 45 with the 
exception of land used for agricultural, mining, 
smelting, refining, transportation, industrial or 
manufacturing purposes, golf course, cemeteries, 
or outdoor entertainment uses.   Private property 
owners can petition for annexation as described 
in Part 46.  When property owners petition for 
annexation, the City of Billings’ Annexation 
Policy requires them to enter into an annexation 
agreement and comply with the other conditions 
under which annexation will occur.  The 
Annexation Policy is used to help plan for 
expansion and provision of municipal services.  
In 2004, a ‘Limits of Annexation’ map was 
added to the policy indicating which areas 
surrounding the City limits could be reasonably 
supported for annexation if requested by the 
property owner.  This map was developed based 
on expected and potential capital improvements 
the City has planned and is updated annually in 
coordination with the City’s Capital 
Improvements Plan.    

Urban Planning Area 

The Urban Planning Area is an area surrounding 
the City of Billings established for the purpose 
of planning for its future growth within a 10-
year horizon.  The UPA was initially created in 
1967 under Article 20-300, BMCC, and has 
historically been the City’s growth boundary.  
The UPA policy states that no City services shall 
be provided outside of the UPA; however, to 
quote a 1980 study, “the UPA is not designed to 
limit growth, merely limit the amount of land 
that is consumed and reduce the cost of services 
needed when this growth occurs.”  Expansion of 
the UPA requires the completion of an Urban 
Planning Study so that the City can determine 
the impacts of annexing and serving the 
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property.  City departments review UPS 
documents for conformance with operating 
policies, capital improvement plans, the Growth 
Policy, and other plans.  A property must be 
within the Urban Planning area before it can be 
annexed into the City limits.   

Urban Renewal Districts 

Title 7, Chapter 15, Part 42 of MCA, otherwise 
known as the Urban Renewal Law, gives 
municipalities the authority to redevelop and 
rehabilitate “blighted” areas.  State law 
specifies requirements for preparing Urban 
Renewal Plans and also authorizes the 
expenditure of funds on Urban Renewal 
Districts, including tax increment funds.  Urban 
Renewal Plans have been most recently 
prepared in 2006 for the ‘East Billings Urban 
Renewal District’ located east of downtown to 
MetraPark, and in 2008 for the ‘South Billings 
Boulevard Urban Renewal Area’ located near 
the South Billings Boulevard interchange.  

Departmental Work Plans 

Every City and County department develops 
annual work plans to assist them in their 
budgeting process.  Work plans establish a list 
of priority projects that the department can 
implement within the year, in addition to their 
regular work duties.  For some departments, 
such as the Planning and Community Services 
and Parks, Recreation and Public Lands 
Departments, the annual work plan is reviewed 
and approved by their citizen advisory boards.  
Work plans are also programming tools that 
establish the timeframes for completion of 
priority tasks and projects. 

Financial Tools 

Capital Improvements Programs 

The City of Billings adopts an annual Capital 
Improvements Plan (CIP) which identifies all 
capital projects that are in excess of $25,000 
and equipment needs in excess of $5,000.  The 
projects and equipment needs are then 
prioritized and budgeted over a five year 

period.  The City undertakes a comprehensive 
review of the Capital Improvements Plan every 
two years.  The importance of a CIP for land 
use planning is the critical connection between 
where and when infrastructure is provided and 
what the desired land use pattern is for a 
community or neighborhood.  Proposals 
included in the CIP are reviewed for 
compliance with adopted land use and 
transportation planning policies.   

Fee Incentives 

Some City and County departments are 
authorized to charge fees for their services and 
facility maintenance.  The most common fees 
are for solid waste service, storm drainage, 
water and sewer service.  The location of 
development can be influenced by tying the 
location to a fee increase or decrease.  
Municipalities, particularly, have the ability to 
develop a utility fee structure that can be used 
as an incentive for directing growth. 

Purchase of Development Rights 

A Purchase of Development Rights (PDR) 
program involves the outright purchase of 
development rights from a private property 
owner by local or state governments to preserve 
resource land.  Funding for PDRs can come 
from sources such as bond initiatives, grants, 
and public matching funds programs.  The 
difference between PDRs and land acquisition 
is that a property owner in a PDR program can 
continue to use this land in ways that are 
consistent with the objectives of the PDR 
program.  PDR procedures have not been 
developed in Yellowstone County. 

Land Acquisition 

Land acquisition programs involve a 
jurisdiction or organization purchasing land 
usually for some public benefit.  Some 
communities and organizations have used this 
tool to purchase land to be used for affordable 
housing development; others have used it to 
purchase property for its open space or 
agricultural value. 
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Impact Fees 

An impact fee is a charge on new development 
assessed by a governmental entity at the time of 
the development approval process to pay for the 
construction or expansion of off-site capital 
improvements that are necessitated by and 
benefit the new development.  In 2005, the state 
legislature passed enabling legislation known as 
the “Montana Impact Fee Act” (7-6-1601, et 
seq., MCA) to allow local governments to 
establish impact fees provided certain 
requirements are met.  In general, the collection 
and expenditure of impacts fees must be 
reasonably related to and reasonably attributed 
to the development’s share of the cost of 
infrastructure improvements made necessary by 
the new development.   

Educational Tools 

Inventories and Planning Studies 

Land use policies and decisions can be better 
informed if supported by studies and inventories.  
Typically, these studies help identify and rank 
critical social, environmental, historic and 
cultural resources.  Studies and inventories can 
also provide the rational nexus required for 
exactions and other dedications.  The 
information obtained from these studies must be 
well organized, accurate and easy to understand.  
Maps and databases developed using 
Geographic Information Systems can satisfy 
these criteria. 

Land Evaluation and Site Assessment System 
(LESA) 

The Land Evaluation and Site Assessment 
(LESA) system helps state and local officials 
make sound decisions about land use by 
providing a technical framework to numerically 
rank land parcels based on local resource 
evaluation and site considerations.   The results 
of land evaluation programs can be incorporated 
into zoning regulations. 

 

Health Impact Assessments (HIA) 

The built environment can have substantial 
effects on the health of the community.  By 
using a new tool known as the Health Impact 
Assessment, or HIA, one can research the 
potential health effects of an anticipated policy, 
program or project and offer recommendations 
to increase positive health outcomes and 
minimize potential adverse health effects.  HIAs 
are similar in some ways to Environmental 
Impact Assessments (EIAs), which are mandated 
processes that focus on potential environmental 
outcomes of a proposed project, such as changes 
in air and water quality.  However, unlike EIAs, 
HIAs are currently voluntary assessments that 
can be used to focus on possible community 
health outcomes of a proposal and subsequently 
highlight proactive measures to improve 
individual or community health.  For example, 
an HIA may identify that a project or policy may 
inadvertently cause physical inactivity and lead 
to obesity, or that it may negatively impact air 
quality which may increase asthma occurrences, 
or even that it may promote inefficiencies in 
design that may lead to increased injuries. In 
these cases, the HIA would then recommend 
project alterations in order to help resolve these 
detrimental health impacts before they occur.  
HIAs are being increasingly used to proactively 
promote social equity and improve the health of 
many growing communities. 

Cooperative Tools 

Interjurisdictional Coordination and 
Partnerships 

The City and County must coordinate their 
efforts on several levels to provide safe and 
dependable services to the public.  The 
Metropolitan Planning Organization (MPO) is 
an important mechanism for ensuring that 
transportation projects are coordinated between 
the City and the County.  Both jurisdictions have 
representation in the MPO and jurisdictional 
interests are further represented by members 
from the joint City-County Planning Board.  The 
Planning Board is composed of City and County 
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residents and is advisory to both the City 
Council and the County Commissioners.  The 
Billings Fire Department also cooperates with 
the County and other Fire District to provide 
services outside the City.  Many quasi-
governmental boards also have cooperative 
agreements with the City and County such as 
the Billings Downtown Partnership and Big 
Sky Economic Development Authority.  It is 
through these partnerships that the interest of 
all jurisdictions are discussed and addressed. 

Interagency Coordination 

Some federal, state and local government land 
management agencies share similar 
responsibilities for the same resources.  In some 
cases, these agencies are not well informed of 
other agencies’ proposed plans or tasks. This 
lack of communication can result in ineffective 
policies or inconsistent regulations if agencies 
do not coordinate their planning and 
implementation efforts.  Opportunities for 
interagency coordination are particularly 
possible in land and water conservation areas 
because the resources overlap agency 
jurisdictions. 

Conservation Easements 

Conservation easements are cooperative tools 
whereby a landowner voluntarily severs the 
development rights from the property and sells 
or donates them to a third party.  The 
landowner is able to retain title to property and 
use it for resource purposes and at the same 
time help preserve critical resources such as 
wildlife habitat, wetlands or riparian areas, 
agricultural lands, forested lands or land with 
other scenic or natural resources.  The 
severance of development rights can be done 
through purchase or donation and may result in 
a tax benefit to the property owner.   

Conservation Reserve Program 

In cooperation with the Natural Resource and 
Conservation Service, eligible farmers and 
ranchers may participate in the Conservation 
Reserve Program (CRP) to address soil, water, 

and related natural resource concerns on their 
lands in an environmentally beneficial and cost-
effective manner. The Conservation Reserve 
Program reduces soil erosion, protects the 
Nation's ability to produce food and fiber, 
reduces sedimentation in streams and lakes, 
improves water quality, establishes wildlife 
habitat, and enhances forest and wetland 
resources. It encourages farmers and ranchers 
to convert highly erodible cropland and 
rangeland or other environmentally sensitive 
acreage to vegetative cover, such as tame or 
native grasses, wildlife plantings, trees, 
filterstrips, or riparian buffers.  Farmers and 
ranchers receive an annual rental payment for 
the term of the multi-year contract.  Cost 
sharing is provided to establish the vegetative 
cover practices. 

IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES 

As a result of the public involvement process 
during the 2003 preparation of the Growth 
Policy, 45 City and County issues were 
identified and categorized into eight 
‘Elements’. As part of this 2008 Growth Policy, 
these elements will continue to be used, and a 
new ‘Community Health’ element has been 
added.  The 9 Elements include:  Land Use, 
Economic Development, Aesthetics, Natural 
Resources, Open Space and Recreation, 
Transportation, Public Facilities and Services, 
Cultural and Historic Resources, and 
Community Health.  Under each element, 
issues are restated as a goal or positive 
outcome, and strategies for implementing or 
achieving the goals are listed.  Since 2003, a 
number of issues have been addressed and 
resolved; some issues involve on-going 
implementation, while others have not yet been 
addressed. 

2008 Updates 

A major goal of the 2008 Growth Policy is to 
evaluate which issues identified in the 2003 
Growth Policy have been addressed, and what 
implementation strategies were used in 
addressing the issues.  Coupled with this ‘status 
report’ goal, is the goal to update the issues and 
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strategies by adding new ones, deleting those 
that are complete or no longer relevant or 
change them to make them relevant.  To this 
end, an evaluation by Planning staff indicated 
that of the 45 issues and 235 implementation 
strategies identified in the 2003 Growth Policy, 
the community has taken some form of action 
on all of the issues and 203 of the possible 
implementation strategies.  This equates to an 
85% action rate.  In terms of what remains as 
issues, goals, and implementation strategies for 
this 2008 Growth Policy, many issues and 
strategies are on-going and will remain.  
However, new growth concerns and trends have 
emerged over the past five years that have 
resulted in the addition of a number of new 
issues and strategies to this 2008 policy.  In 
total, this document presents 69 issues, and 393 
implementation strategies for consideration. 
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  LAND USE ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I:   Neighborhoods are experiencing pressures from new development and land use 
 changes. 

POLICY I:   Preserve neighborhood integrity by creating neighborhood plans that specifically address 
 land use issues. 
 
1. When funding sources become available, develop  more neighborhood plans that: 

a. Make recommendations for land use that may include areas suitable for multi-family housing, 
manufactured home parks, condominiums and basement apartments  

b. Develop goals for transit and multi-modal paths and trails 
c. Identify desired capital improvement projects for the neighborhood 
d. Identify neighborhood assets that are important to preserve and celebrate  
e. Assess the adequacy of parks and open space in the neighborhood  
f. Make recommendations for the maintenance and use of neighborhood schools 
g. Support a full range of housing opportunities 
h. Minimize through traffic on local streets 
i. Discourage parking on local streets for non-residential purposes. 

OR  The Planning Board may annually assess the needs of neighborhoods to identify the residents’ prefer-
ence for land use and capital improvement. The assessment shall be conducted in a formally structured 
process to ensure a representative and reliable indication of residents’ preferences. 

2.  The City and County may prioritize neighborhoods for urban renewal plans (7-15-4206(18), MCA) to ad-
dress:  
a. Any land acquisition, demolition and removal of structures, redevelopment, improvements 

and  rehabilitation that is proposed to be carried out 
b. Land uses, maximum and minimum densities, building requirements 
c. The plan’s relationship to definite local objectives respecting appropriate land uses, improved 

traffic, public transportation, public utilities, recreation and community facilities, and other public 
improve-ments, service, and facility needs 

3. During the neighborhood planning process each neighborhood may develop its own recommenda-
tions to establish:  
a. Minimum or maximum development densities 
b. Height of structures  
c. Maximum and minimum parking standards 
d. Appropriate regulations for allowed uses   
e. Architectural design standards 

4. Each neighborhood may define its boundary. 

5. Increase enforcement of zoning and building permit requirements. 

6. When considering land use applications support existing neighborhood plans. 

7. Encourage neighborhoods to review  their plans annually and report implementation progress to the 
City and County. 

8. Educate the public on how capital improvement projects are prioritized and funded. 
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ISSUE II: The current zoning ordinances and subdivision regulations do not always prevent incompati-
 ble uses in and adjacent to existing City neighborhoods and County townsites.  
POLICY II:  Ensure that development is compatible with the character of the neighborhood or townsite 
  in which it is occurring. 
 
1. When revising the zoning ordinance consider the following: 

a. Reduce uses permitted in Neighborhood Commercial districts that are inappropriate for residential 
neighborhoods, such as tattoo parlors and some types of drive-through businesses 

b. Review existing commercial zoning district uses, specifically those adjacent to residential uses, to 
identify potential incompatible uses and conflicts with surrounding properties.   

c. Further restrict or condition gaming and casino licenses 
d. Concentrations of corrections facilities in any one neighborhood should be discouraged 
e. Allow for additional business uses on a limited basis that act as business incubators  
f. Support mixed use developments that exhibits elements of compatibility 
g. Neighborhood plans should be considered during zoning review processes 
 

2. When revising the zoning ordinance consider requiring commercial development to: 
a. Use shared service areas including driveways, parking, and service areas  
b. Consolidate width of driveways and curb cuts across public sidewalks  
c. Shield service and utility functions 
d. Limit surface parking between the front of the building and the sidewalk  
e. Orient new development in a similar fashion as existing development 
f. Provide a reasonable transition in scale, including height of structure and density  
g. Explore requiring architectural standards for buildings to create attractive streetscapes 
h. Provide landscaped edges in developed areas to define the edges and visually screen automobile or 

other service uses 
 

3. County officials may consider extending zoning across the entire county to prevent incompatible uses adja-
cent to existing residential and agricultural properties.  Existing Special Zoning Districts should be kept 
intact. 

4. Consider creating standards to include in the zoning ordinance that define compatibility and consider such 
factors as: 
a. Residential development would be no more than one story difference to adjoining uses  
b. Create similar vehicular trip generation 
c. Have no greater lot coverage 
d. Contain proportionally no more parking spaces, out buildings or garages than neighboring develop-

ment  
e. Setbacks would deviate no more than 10% 
f. Use of similar building materials 

5. The City and County may adopt interim zoning as an emergency measure to address incompatible uses. 

6. Encourage the use of private covenants, conditions and restrictions for subdivisions, while acknowledg-
ing that these restrictions are not enforced by local government.  
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ISSUE III:  Rural townsites are not prepared to handle increased growth. 

POLICY III:  Equip rural townsites with tools to plan for increased population or to plan to in 
  crease population. 
 
1. When funding sources become available, prepare community plans (similar to neighborhood plans) for 

Broadview, Acton, Lockwood, Shepherd, Huntley Project (Huntley, Worden and Ballantine) and Cus-
ter. The community plan may:  
a. Make recommendations for land use that include areas suitable for a variety of housing types, 

commercial, and industrial uses 
b. Identify desired capital improvement projects for the community  
c. Identify community assets such as agricultural and mineral resources that are important to preserve 

and celebrate 
d. Assess the adequacy of parks and recreation facilities in the community  
e. Support a full range of housing opportunities 
f. Minimize through traffic on local streets, improve safety of intersections with state highways and 

improve safety of state secondary routes and county section line roads 
 

2. Involve rural school districts and fire districts in community plan development and implementation. 

3. Each community may develop its own recommendations to establish:  
a. Appropriate land use tools to guide development, such as zoning 
b. Capital improvement and facility priorities 
c. A community planning committee that will oversee implementation of the plan  
d. A water and/or sewer district 
e. Funding sources including Community Development Block Grants and Human Resources Devel-

opment Council grants 

4. Each community may define its boundary. 

5. As funding is available, provide technical and funding assistance to help implement community plans. 

6. Encourage community planning committees to review community plans annually and report progress 
to the County Commissioners.  

7. Continue to implement County community decay ordinance. 

8. Encourage the use of citizen-initiated zoning for unzoned, County communities and subdivisions (76--
2-101 et seq., MCA). 

ISSUE IV: Urban sprawl threatens the rural character of land surrounding Billings, increases the 
  cost of providing public services, and threatens the vitality of the city core and Down
  town.  

POLICY IV:  Coordinate efforts to concentrate development in and adjacent to existing City limits. 
 
1. Define urban sprawl within subdivision & zoning regulations in order to identify solutions to the issue. 

2. Define “neighborhood” within subdivision and zoning regulations based on land use and transportation 
criteria such as walking distance from edge to edge, housing density, connectivity, lot sizes and prox-
imity to community amenities and centers of commerce. 
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3. Encourage the development of neighborhoods, not just housing developments. 

4. Provide incentives for urban redevelopment. Strategies may include: 
a. Fee waivers 
b. Tax Increment Finance Districts (TIFD) 
c. Tiered cost of service districts 
 

5. Provide fee and development standard incentives for urban infill development and low to moderate in-
come housing. Strategies may include: 
a. Fee zones based on distance to water and wastewater treatment plants  
b. Prorated charge for service extensions 
c. Fee waivers 
d. Density and open space incentives offered to developers 
e. Phased tax relief and City development subsidies 
f. Tiered cost of service districts 
g. Impact fees (City only)  
h. Encourage special zoning for developments that provide for mixed uses 
i. Tax relief for developments that reduce vehicular traffic and encourage “green” building practices 

such as attention to energy efficiency, use of local or recycled materials, use of trees for shade and 
wind breaks, and water conservation practices   

6. Encourage environmentally responsible and sustainable development through enabling building codes 
and development regulations. 

7. Support construction of community facilities for each neighborhood to create a sense of community 
(technical support, not necessarily financial).   

8. Implement the West Billings Plan by adopting recommended changes to the zoning ordinances and sub-
division regulations and expanding the County Zoning jurisdiction 

9. Evaluate and recommend appropriate rural growth management techniques designed to concentrate de-
velop-ment while preserving agricultural land, sensitive natural environments and open space. Techniques 
may include:  
a. A program to transfer development rights or purchase development rights  
b. Cluster or conservation-style development 
c. Performance zoning designed to limit large lot subdivisions and encourage mixed use 
d. A performance evaluation for development proposals based on the Land Evaluation and Site Assess-

ment (LESA) system developed by the U.S. Department of Agriculture, Soil Conservation Service 
 

10. Consider revising zoning code to increase the lot size required for land used for agricultural purposes. 
 
11. Update City annexation policy to require contiguous annexation to the city.  Annexation of entire proper
 ties should be required, not just piece by piece. 
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ISSUE V:    There is a serious lack of affordable housing for low to moderate income house 
  holds.  

POLICY V:  Enable the development of affordable housing in appropriate areas throughout the  
   City and County. 

1. Define Affordable Housing versus Workforce Housing in subdivision and zoning regulations. 

2. Direct staff to evaluate the alternatives available for affordable housing and bring them to the govern-
ing bodies for consideration. 

3. Provide incentives for affordable housing projects by reducing infrastructure and permitting require-
ments where appropriate. 

4. Identify and rezone appropriate areas for new manufactured home parks with strict design stan-
dards. 

5. Develop Downtown housing strategies. 

6. Encourage mixed use developments, specifically in the downtown with commercial offices and 
retail on the ground floor and apartments above. 

7. Support the City’s Affordable Housing strategies by training code enforcement, police, and 
County Health personnel on housing rehabilitation and homebuyer assistance programs.  

8. Ensure that multi-family units are compatible with surrounding land use. 

9. Continue County’s involvement with the various community groups to support strategies to de-
velop and maintain affordable housing, provide equal housing opportunity and to revitalize 
neighborhoods. 

ISSUE VI:  There is a desire for more mixed-use neighborhoods. 

POLICY VI:  Create diverse and vibrant neighborhoods that offer convenient places to work, learn, and 
shop within walking distance of residences. 

 
1. Consider modifying zoning regulations to include: 

a. Mixed-use development zones 
b. “Urban village overlay zones” 
c. Performance-based zoning codes1 for major corridors throughout the city to create quality mixed use 

developments 

2. Consider adding mixed-use or planned unit development design standards in subdivision regulations. 

3. Encourage and provide incentives for developments that have mass transit services or alternative 
transportation options within walking or biking distance to promote community health. 

4. Evaluate the potential to rezone portions of commercial strips to allow for mixed-use, especially va-
cant shopping malls. 

5. Formulate more types of single family zoning districts. 
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2. Rehabilitate older residences along arterial streets into mixed uses with both commercial and 
residential elements. 

3. Assess impact fees and higher cost of service fees for previously undeveloped land far from the city 
center (City only). 

4. Increase streetscape attractiveness through landscaping and architectural standards for developments. 
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I:   We need to continue a cohesive focus in economic development. 
POLICY I:  Collaborate on the development of a strategic plan for economic 

development. 
 
1. Support efforts to revitalize Downtown by increasing investment and capital improvements in 

Downtown Billings. 

2. Attract better paying jobs. 

3. Target employment clusters using public and private partnerships. 

4. Encourage existing businesses to expand. 

5. Support business linkages that locate close to support services. 

6. Facilitate the development of vacant infill parcels. 

7. Utilize targeted employment clusters when developing public/private partnerships. 

8. The Planning and Community Services Department should take a greater role in economic 
development with regard to land use information resources. 

9. Inventory infill opportunities and explore the creation of a Transfer of Development Rights system 
for infill incentives. 

10. Consider a beneficial use tax or other special assessments such as public safety districts so that all 
service users, including tax exempt properties, contribute for services rendered. 

11. Improve and coordinate community-wide adult education opportunities. 

12. Facilitate the coordination of economic development groups, local businesses, and K-12 education 
to ensure preparation of a qualified workforce.  

ISSUE II:   Lack of living wage jobs. 

POLICY II:  Attract businesses with a minimum average annual wage equal to the living annual 
wage. 

1. Report regularly to public on how economic development dollars are spent. 

2. Coordinate efforts among City, County, schools and major businesses. 

3. Support the goals identified by Big Sky Economic Development Authority to attract new businesses 
and retain existing businesses by providing them with economic development resources.  

4. Develop collaborative partnerships with various economic development efforts throughout 
Yellowstone County. 

5. Provide community information and permitting assistance to businesses looking to relocate to 
Yellowstone County or existing businesses wishing to expand. 
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6. Encourage retention and recruitment of businesses that offer competitive wages and benefits. 

7. Improve marketing of our community to employers paying a living wage. 

 
ISSUE III:  The entryways to our communities should be attractive and not present physical 
  barriers discouraging economic development. 

POLICY III:  Encourage good design, create attractive entryways and rights-of-way, and improve 
access to and through Billings and Yellowstone County. 

1. Provide incentives for businesses in the areas of design, landscaping, etc. 

2. Designate areas within the zoning jurisdiction as “Business Parks”.  Design traffic circulation within 
these Business Parks and truck routes to these Business Parks to accommodate existing businesses 
and minimize conflicts with adjacent neighborhoods. 

3. Consider committing City and County resources, where appropriate, to maintain attractive and 
welcoming infrastructure at all entryways to Billings and Lockwood. 

4. Construct and maintain attractive rest areas in the urban interstate corridor in conjunction with 
Montana Department of Transportation. 

5. Expand the wayfinding signage to direct people to great destinations in Billings and Yellowstone 
County. 

6. Public facilities, including City, County, and Federal buildings, and university and college 
campuses, should be attractive and inviting. 

7. Infrastructure, particularly rights-of-way and parks should be maintained and enhanced. 

8. Consider regulating building design by implementing design standards and review, limited to certain 
high-visibility districts. 

9. Enforce Community Decay Ordinance along Interstate Corridor and other highly visible rights-of-
way. 

ISSUE IV:    Government supported programs and improvements are not sufficiently funded. 

POLICY IV:  Find better ways to fund government services. 

1. Mitigate insurance and assessed value increases on property. 

2. Consider implementing some form of City service funding through sales tax or local option tax if 
tied to property tax reduction.  

3. Seek HUD Section 108 loans for low income neighborhoods, coupled with brownfield economic 
development projects to fund infrastructure projects. 

4. Consider all costs and benefits, including possible alternative revenue streams, before considering 
sale of city property (like PARK 4, Library)  
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ISSUE V: Like many other Montana cities, the economic viability of Downtown Billings is 
uncertain. 

POLICY V: Support private and public initiatives to strengthen the economic viability of 
Downtown Billings. 

1. Create new tax increment finance districts if, after analysis, the existing TIF was demonstrated to 
be effective. 

2. Support economic development efforts that would encourage a sustainable Downtown economy. 

3. Facilitate programs that would encourage property renovation in the Downtown. 

4. Foster partnerships between major employers to encourage them to remain or move Downtown. 

5. Increase parking, considering alternatives to surface parking, in the Downtown to encourage 
economic development. 

6. Seek financial assistance for building rehabilitation. 

7. Encourage the improved appearance of storefronts. 

8. Encourage the development and expansion of educational opportunities at the high school and 
post-secondary levels to bring people into the Downtown. 
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ISSUE VI:   Safety Downtown is an important element. 

POLICY VI:  Create and maintain a safe, attractive, vibrant downtown. 

1. Create a downtown police officer position similar to a school “Resource Officer.” 

2. Build on the energy MSU-B downtown campus has brought to Downtown by providing more forms 
of recreation and gathering places for students. 

3. Encourage Downtown residential development for all incomes, including student housing, by 
promoting mixed use. 

4. Encourage extended hours for businesses to promote more activity Downtown. 

5. Facilitate the development more pedestrian-friendly facilities Downtown such as: 
• pedestrian mall  
• greenspace or parks 
• bus stops to support businesses 
• free (or low cost) bus fares for Downtown destinations 

6. Ensure safe parking downtown. 

7. Address and enforce the homelessness and loitering issue in the Downtown and adjacent 
neighborhoods. 

ISSUE VII:  Surrounding communities in the County need economic development to sustain them. 

POLICY VII:  Provide economic development assistance to rural communities. 

1. Provide technical assistance to rural community groups when requested for establishing community 
foundations, and other grant seeking entities. 

2. Promote business development in rural communities by supporting the activities of Big Sky EDA 
and Beartooth RC&D. 

3. Explore the coordination of existing public transportation options from rural communities to Billings 
for para-transit and encourage organized commuter and car-pooling options. 

ISSUE VIII:  Billings needs to attract businesses that pay higher wages. 

POLICY VIII:  Promote high value businesses such as technology and extractive industries. 

1. Accelerate environmental review of large development projects. 

2. Focus on recruiting environmentally and socially responsible industries. 

3. Provide and promote ‘quality of life’ amenities to attract new high value businesses including open 
space and recreation opportunities and access, improved library facilities, increased community-
wide cultural activities like museum exhibits, community concerts and street markets or craft fairs.  

4. Work with the State to promote and recognize Billings industry as safe and responsible, hence 
lowering workers’ compensation premiums for potential high value employers. 
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ISSUE IX:  The economic development of Billings Heights is overlooked. 

POLICY IX:  Promote business development in Billings Heights. 

1. Explore the creation of a Tax Increment Finance District in the Heights. 

2. Develop “Bench Boulevard Connector” to reduce traffic pressure on Main Street. 

3. Develop “Inner Belt Loop” to connect Heights with the rest of the City, and develop a detailed land 
use plan to Master Plan commercial and residential development along it.  

ISSUE X:  The quality and focus of our schools is a determining factor for whether businesses 
locate in Billings. 

POLICY X:  The Billings and Yellowstone County School Districts will provide high quality K-12 
education. 

1. Provide for school improvement and ongoing facility maintenance. 

2. Evaluate and celebrate student achievement. 

3. Enhance community relationships and involvement in the school districts. 

4. Address financial resource needs at the state and local level. 

5. Encourage cooperative school and community planning. 

6. Engage the schools to address local workforce needs. 

ISSUE XI:  Neighborhoods provide the character and strength of the community and the quality 
of neighborhoods should be preserved. 

POLICY XI:  Create self-sustaining neighborhoods by preserving the character and enhancing 
the quality of life in our neighborhoods. 

 
1. Ensure interconnections between neighborhoods while maintaining a cohesive neighborhood 

character. 

2. Provide focal points in neighborhoods by adding value to spaces and making spaces into places. 

3. Provide neighborhood amenities that serve the residents, including: 
a. Theatres 
b. Parks 
c. Work places 

4. Community leaders should bring neighborhoods together by supporting mutually beneficial projects. 

5. Consider preserving the character of older neighborhoods by establishing design standards. 

6. Support neighborhood efforts to preserve historic value by facilitating National Register of Historic 
Preservation entries. 

7. Preserve and maintain neighborhood schools. 

8. Integrate neighborhood schools into neighborhood life for all ages. 
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ISSUE XII:  The Billings economy faces a severe shortage of skilled workers in a number of 
sectors (a problem that will worsen as the population ages). 

POLICY XII:  Facilitate community-wide long-range planning for workforce development, with 
special emphasis on engaging the cooperation of local public schools and 
institutions of higher education. 

 
1. Improve communication between the business community and educational institutions. 

2. Facilitate coordination between the business community, economic development agencies, and the 
school districts to: 

a. Develop a comprehensive community plan for workforce development. 
b. Increase enrollment in high school career education at the Billings Career Center. 
c. Expand the curriculum at the Billings Career Center to address local workforce needs. 
d. Support efforts to improve the coordination of curricula between the Billings Career Center 

and MSU-B College of Technology. 
e. Educate K-12 students and parents about workforce needs and local education opportunities. 
f. Reduce the high school dropout rate. 

3. Improve and coordinate community-wide adult education opportunities. 
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  AESTHETICS ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I:   There are areas in the City and County that are unattractive and present a poor image of the 

community.  

POLICY I:  Certain areas have been targeted to increase the aesthetic or visual quality of the community: 
the Rimrocks, the Yellowstone River, Downtown Billings and urban streetscapes. 

1. Rimrocks. The face of the rimrocks has the advantage of being unbuildable due to topography. Strategies 
to preserve the view corridor created by the rimrocks may include: 
a. Prepare a detailed study on the status and location of billboards along N. 27th and 6th Avenue N. and 

work with sign owners to cure nonconformities. 
b. Develop safe trails along the base or top of the rimrocks to allow for public access. 
c. Limit antennas, towers, and utility and communication lines in the vicinity of the 

rimrocks.  
d. Publicly acquire rimrock property. 
e. Explore the creation of an overlay district along the rims to require more restrictive setbacks, 

landscape, building design standards, and building heights. 

2. Yellowstone River. The river is the front door of Yellowstone County.   Strategies to protect the river 
may include: 
a. Restrict further industrial zoning adjacent to the Yellowstone River. 
b. Implement the recreational plans in Parks 2020 and Yellowstone River Greenway Master Plan and 

include historical and cultural resources of Yellowstone River. 
c. Extend public open space and access along the riverfront. 
d. Strict enforcement of building restrictions in the floodway and floodplain.  
e. Expand noxious weed removal program along river banks. 
f. Revegetate degraded areas with native species. 
g. Explore the creation of an overlay district along the river and Interstate 90 to require more 

restrictive setbacks, landscape, building design standards, and building separation from river. 
h. Encourage local groups to organize an annual river bank cleanup day choosing a different problem 

area each time. 
i. Encourage more recreational use of the Yellowstone River and use the river as a selling point to 

travelers to the Billings area. 
j. Enhance trails along the river with interpretive signs to explain habitat and items of interest. 

3.  Downtown. Recent streetscape improvements have made a big difference in the aesthetics of 
Downtown. Strategies to further improve the visual experience in the Downtown are:  
a. Expand the Downtown Historic District with property owner involvement.  
b. Require street trees to be planted along all streets coming into Billings from I-90. 
c. Consider adding center median landscape plantings funded by arterial fee increase. 

4. Streetscape. Pedestrian friendly streets and neighborhoods result in a high quality of life. Strategies to 
improve the urban streetscape may include: 
a. Consider requiring street trees to be planted along boulevard walks. 
b. Permit special street signage to identify neighborhoods. 
c. Require boulevard sidewalks in residential developments. 
d. Narrower streets in new residential developments to reduce traffic speed with the requirement for 

street trees. 
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ISSUE II: New development and signs, cell towers, power lines and other structures could reduce the 
visual quality of the rims. 

POLICY II:  Maintain an undeveloped buffer zone along the Rimrocks surrounding Billings. 

1. Prepare a Visual Resource Preservation Plan that includes an inventory of important visual resources 
and recommended plan of action to preserve those resources. Involve all stakeholders in the planning 
process and arrive at consensus. 

2. Adopt subdivision regulations that favor park land dedication along the face and top of rimrocks. 

3. Publicly acquire land along the face and top of the rimrocks to eliminate the potential of inappropriate 
development. 

4. Consider adopting an overlay district along the rims that restrict building heights, have building design 
criteria, landscape requirements to be like what grows on the rims. 

5.  Encourage the creation of contiguous public space across the rims. 

ISSUE III: Urban interstate corridors through the County are unattractive.  

POLICY III: Create a visually appealing urban interstate corridor. 

1. Reevaluate the need for appropriate sign standards for the corridor. 

2. When corridor improvement projects are planned, consider landscaping and irrigating major intersec-
tions through Billings. 

3. Negotiate with MDT for better clean up and maintenance of interstate right-of-way. 

4. Explore the creation of an overlay district along Interstate 90 to require more restrictive setbacks, land-
scaping and buffering enhancements, and building design standards. 

5. Screen outdoor storage within the corridor. 

6. Encourage the continuation of planted berms adjacent to the refinery areas. 

7. Construct attractive interchange signs to welcome visitors to Billings. 

Chapter 5.1:  Implementation Tools and Strategies 



Page 220 

IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  NATURAL RESOURCES ELEMENT 
 

ISSUE I:   The quality of the Yellowstone River and the associated riparian habitat is 
threatened. 

POLICY I:  Strive to protect the Yellowstone River so that wildlife, wildlife habitat, water quality 
and quantity, recreational activities and aesthetic values will be preserved. 

1. Coordinate planning and management efforts with other land management agencies in efforts to 
protect and preserve stream banks, floodplains and riparian habitats. 

2. Support river protection measures by establishing a conservation corridor along the Yellowstone 
River.  Provide incentives as improvement requirements in subdivision regulations. 

3. Monitor the amount of development activity in and adjacent to the Yellowstone River to detect 
negative trends. Consider adjusting zoning and floodplain regulations to minimize or eliminate 
development pressure on the natural system. 

4. Complete floodplain mapping on the Yellowstone, Clarks Fork and Big Horn Rivers. 

5. Promote best management practices to ensure compatible and suitable land development in the river 
valley. 

6. Encourage coordination and collaboration among all of the existing river conservation groups to 
focus mutual efforts for the benefit of all.  

ISSUE II:   Water is an important resource and it is becoming scarcer. 

POLICY II:  Policy: Protect groundwater quality and conserve existing water supplies. 

1. Implement Phase II Stormwater Regulations in the City of Billings and Yellowstone County. 

2. Identify areas of groundwater recharge and shallow groundwater, including wetland mapping, and 
ensure protective land use controls are followed.  

3. Encourage native, drought resistant landscape where possible. 

4. Explore options for storm water management that recharge ground water rather than discharge into 
storm sewers. 

ISSUE III:  Due in part to the arid nature of our environment and the remoteness of some 
developments, there is an increased risk to human life and property from wildfires. 

POLICY III:  Reduce the risk of wildfire and limit the amount of property damage resulting from 
wildfires. 

1. Encourage in-fill development to eliminate sprawl by providing development incentives. 

2. Increase fire prevention education, including training on creating defensible space around 
structures. 
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ISSUE IV:  Weeds detract from the beauty of an area, pose a fire danger, and reduce the 
productivity of agricultural land. 

POLICY IV: Control the existing infestation of noxious weeds with the goal of eradication and 
prevent the introduction of new noxious weed species. 

1. Continue ongoing state and local efforts to educate landowners, County departments and other 
agencies on weed control. 

2. Adopt a City Weed Management Plan in compliance with State law and revise subdivision 
regulations to require compliance with the plan. 

3. Implement “weed free” gravel mine requirements in Yellowstone County. 

4. Aggressively pursue multi-treatment techniques including, biological, chemical, and land use 
techniques to reduce or eliminate the spread of noxious weeds.  Emphasize biological controls. 

5. Take care when using chemical weed control to limit human contact and consumption. 

6. Develop a cooperative weed management agreement between the City of Billings and 
Yellowstone County to ensure County weed plans are implemented. 

ISSUE V:  Human encounters with wildlife often result in a painful consequence for wildlife, 
pets and humans. 

POLICY V: Minimize conflicts between wildlife and residential development. 

1. Identify and map areas of important wildlife habitat. 

2. Promote and enforce conservation style subdivisions in areas of important wildlife habitat that 
concentrate development away from sensitive habitat. 

3. Install traffic control signs that alert motorist to the presence of wildlife. 

ISSUE VI:  Certain development is damaging our natural resources. 

POLICY VI: Preserve environmentally sensitive areas. 

1. Define, identify and map environmentally sensitive resources throughout the County. 

2. Using floodplain mapping information, river meander analyses, and examples from other 
communities, consider developing local subdivision, zoning or site development regulations to 
limit commercial and industrial land uses along the Yellowstone River and establish species and/
or ecosystem-based requirements for river setbacks for uses and structures. 

3. Consider floating a County-wide permissive levy for public land acquisition of open space.  

4. Introduce landowners and developers to voluntary open space preservation programs such as the 
Conservation Reserve Program, wetland banking and conservation easements. 

5. Develop a network of greenway corridors that connect the Yellowstone River and other drainages 
with City neighborhoods and outlying communities. 
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6. Expand on the Bureau of Mines and Geology’s mapping of geologic hazards in the Billings 
vicinity, to further study of landslide and rockfall potential in the greater County area. 

7. Map flood prone areas in Yellowstone County in accordance with the Federal Emergency 
Management Agency (FEMA)  program, and state and local standards. 

8. As development along waterways occurs, identify floodplain areas that may be utilized for 
parks, greenways, multi-purpose trail networks, and other recreational uses. 

9. Consider utilizing Natural Resource Conservation Service’s Ecological Site Information System 
(ESIS)16 to analyze land for potential public acquisition for open space. The ESIS provides an 
inventory land based on soil, plant, wildlife, surface and groundwater and other conditions. 

10. Consider floating a City levy for 75 to 100 acre land purchases for regional parks. 
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  OPEN SPACE AND RECREATION ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I:    Funding for park development and maintenance is tight. 

POLICY I:  Provide for the equitable distribution of parks and recreation facilities among   
neighborhoods and outlying communities. 

1. Encourage the County to develop and maintain County parkland. 

2. Retain and maintain parks in existing neighborhoods. 

3. Explore the implementation of a Park District or Maintenance District to include the City and 
surrounding County properties. The new District should be managed by a single board that is a 
collaboration between the City and County. 

4. Enable neighborhoods and communities to make choices on park funding mechanisms. 

5. Solicit neighborhood and community involvement in the preparation of park improvement 
planning and programming, to include a community volunteer program to utilize retired persons 
and other community members in the maintenance and development of parks. 

6. Consult Parks2020 and Yellowstone River Greenway Master Plan when exploring parkland 
acquisition recommendations. 

7. Consider the sale of unusable County park land to fund other County park improvements and 
utilize land swaps with other agencies or property owners to consolidate county and city public 
parks and open space.  

8. Investigate whether new commercial development would consider sponsoring park and open space 
development, maintenance and acquisition in the vicinity of the community where the commercial 
development is located or moves to. 

ISSUE II:   Billings and Yellowstone County need more major recreation facilities and need to 
improve those we already have. 

POLICY II:  Prioritize and program the construction and maintenance of major recreational 
facilities. 

1. Develop a proposal for a City-County Park Maintenance District or Park District.  Consider asking 
the voters within the City and County Planning Jurisdiction the question of whether or not the 
District(s) should be created. 

2. Acquire private donations and grants through Billings Park, Recreation and Preservation Fund. 

3. Consider utilizing the Capital Improvements Planning process to support construction of an 
Aquatic Center.  

4. The County Commission would welcome a constituent initiated county-wide Open Space mill levy 
to be placed on the ballot to provide funding for acquisition of open space. 

5. Address transient and homeless abuse of neighborhood parks. 
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ISSUE III:  Private land development sometimes restricts access to public land. 

POLICY III: Ensure continued access to public lands managed for recreational purposes. 

1. Identify and map existing access to public recreational land. 

2. Seek private funding sources and private easements. 

3. Acquire public right-of-way for recreational purposes through existing and proposed development 
that is acceptable to adjoining residence. 

4. Facilitate public access to the Yellowstone River and public lands in the community by exploring 
access options across public roads and rights-of-way and where appropriate and safe open closed or 
blocked roads. 

ISSUE IV:  Billings and surrounding County townsites need more multiple use trails. 

POLICY IV:  Continue to integrate a multi-purpose trail network into the community 
infrastructure that emphasizes safety, environmental preservation, resource 
conservation and cost effectiveness. 

1. Sustain efforts to use the canal systems for trail corridors. 

2. Consider providing shoulders or bike lane improvements on City streets and County roads. 

3. Consider continuing to use CTEP and other transportation funding sources to maintain and construct 
trails.  

4. If a City-County Park Improvement and Park Maintenance District is created, it could consider 
including provisions to improve and maintain trails. 

5. Enable neighborhoods and the community to be a part of the trail placement and design as sections 
of the trail are developed. 

6. Consider adopting bicycle and pedestrian-friendly development review procedures and design 
standards. 

7. Actively pursue easements for multiple use trails. 

8. Acquire and maintain public access above and below the rimrocks.  

9. Prior to the acquisition of open space, ensure that a long range funding mechanism is in place to 
control weed infestation on the acquired property. 

10. In coordination with the school districts encourage ‘safe routes to school’ infrastructure 
improvements to promote safety and reduction of vehicular traffic at/near schools. 
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ISSUE V:  Public access to areas above and below the rimrocks is limited and decreasing each 
year. 

POLCY V:  Preserve existing and develop new opportunities for public access to the rimrocks. 

1. Acquire dedicated land or easements through the subdivision process that ensure public access 
above and below the rims. 

2. Encourage land owners to grant recreational easements that provide access above and below the 
rims. 

ISSUE VI:   Public access to area along the Yellowstone River is limited and decreasing each 
year. 

POLICY VI: Preserve existing and develop new opportunities for public access to the Yellowstone 
River. 

1. Encourage the dedication of land or easements through the subdivision process that ensure public 
access to the Yellowstone River as identified by the Yellowstone River Greenway Master Plan and 
the Heritage Trail Plan. 

2. Encourage land owners to grant recreational easements that provide access to the Yellowstone 
River. 

3. Explore creative opportunities to create new areas open to public access along the Yellowstone 
River, such as: 
a. Removing fences restricting access to public right-of-way at bridges 
b. Wetland banks 
c. Land trades 
d. Conservation easements 
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  TRANSPORTATION ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I: Speeding in City neighborhoods and outlying communities. 

POLICY I:  Ensure traffic speeds in neighborhoods and townsites are maintained at safe levels. 

1. Use traffic calming devices when approved by neighborhood or community residents.  

2. Enforce speed limits. 

3. Educate public about safety aspects of speeding in residential areas by posting informational signage. 

4. Work with the Montana Department of Transportation and Highway Commission to implement 
desired speed limits on State routes. 

5. Utilize speed display equipment. 

6. Police and Sheriff should become more vested in neighborhoods and townsites through increased 
presence. 

7. Increase traffic calming measures near schools. 

8. Consider and mitigate the impacts on traffic through existing neighborhoods when approving new 
developments. 

9. Work with existing neighborhoods experiencing traffic speed and volume concerns to develop and 
fund mitigation strategies. 

ISSUE II: Safe and efficient traffic circulation around and through the City. 

POLICY II:  Improve traffic circulation throughout the urbanized area. 

1. Give higher priority to small traffic control projects such as striping, signing and signaling.  

2. Continue to seek Federal funding for the North By-Pass route. 

3. Designate truck routes on appropriately designed roads and streets and improve truck route signage. 

4. When funding is available and needs arise prepare Transportation Plans for rural townsites. 

5. Plan for and consider new north-south connections to alleviate congestion on existing connections and 
cut-through traffic in neighborhoods. 

6. Use traffic calming devices in residential neighborhoods to discourage cut-through traffic and ensure 
pedestrian safety 

7. Consider impacts on traffic circulation when planning for new schools. 

8. Consider re-routing the eastbound leg of the I-90 Business Loop from Montana Avenue to 1st Avenue 
S. to reduce traffic and enhance revitalization of historic Montana Ave., and offer development 
potential to 1st Ave. S. 
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ISSUE III: Lack of adequate traffic control. 

POLICY III:  Standardize traffic control to improve traffic flow and alleviate congestion. 

1. Analyze and upgrade traffic signals to improve level of service ratings at intersec-tions. 

2. Consider ‘real time’ traffic volumes to make traffic control devices function more efficiently and to 
reduce emissions from idling vehicles. 

3. Coordinate road construction projects with public utility projects. 

4. Institute a standardized public information system for road construction and other public infrastructure 
projects. 

5. Closely monitor accident rates at unsignalized intersections and develop appropriate safety projects to 
reduce these rates. 

6. Coordinate road construction projects to ensure efficient traffic flow. 

7. Bring traffic controls in school zones into compliance with State law. 

8. Place signage on bicycle routes to increase citizen awareness. 

9. Provide school districts and Bike and Pedestrian Advisory Committee annual reports on accident data.  

ISSUE IV: The design of roads, streets and pedestrian facilities can be more attractive and functional.  

POLICY IV:  Update design standards for roadways, streets and sidewalks. 

1. Design road segments to include clear vision triangles, landscaped boulevards and medians, and safe 
pedestrian crossings, especially in urban growth areas. 

2. Consider pedestrian safety and education for navigating roundabouts. 

3. Use context sensitive design 4 to control traffic and improve aesthetics. 

4. Adopt context sensitive design standards for major travel corridors such as Laurel Road, Main Street, 
Shiloh Road, North and South 27th Street, and Highway 87 near MetraPark. 

5. Adopt sidewalk standards based on a rational approach that considers street hierarchy, land use, connec-
tivity and population densities. 

6. Annex all roadways between proposed annexations and existing City limits. 

ISSUE V: Obstacles to efficient and safe traffic flow. 

POLICY V: Eliminate transportation barriers between neighborhoods and institute programs to ensure 
convenient and safe access to neighborhoods. 

1. Coordinate traffic signals. 

2. Complete and implement the Quiet Zone Study to address train traffic in the Downtown.   
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3. Develop and fund the Bench Connector project. 

4. Develop a program for situating employment centers in the Heights to reduce commuter traffic.  

5. Eliminate barriers to public funding for street improvements. 

ISSUE VI: Deteriorated conditions of City streets and County roads. 

POLICY VI:   Provide City and County residents with well-maintained streets and roads through a 
scheduled maintenance and replacement program. 

1. Continue programming City street improvements through the City’s Capital Improvements Plan. 

2. Continue the ongoing City program of maintaining pavement markings, signals, signs and street lights. 

3. Continue to cost-share road improvements with County residents to address immediate concerns. 

ISSUE VII:  Resources for transportation improvements should be rationally allocated throughout 
City neighborhoods and County townsites. 

POLICY VII: Ensure that programmed transportation projects are rationally distributed among 
neighborhoods and outlying communities. 

1. Meet with the neighborhood task forces and County townsite residents regularly to establish priorities. 

2. Give small neighborhood and rural townsite projects funding consideration. 

3. Coordinate street and traffic projects with public utility projects. 

ISSUE VIII:  More convenient bus schedules are needed to attract MET ridership. 

POLICY VIII:  Encourage the use of alternative transportation modes. 

1. Increase the “Buses and Bikes” program. 

2. Consider the use of smaller buses when replacing existing buses. 

3. Continue to implement existing and consider additional programs to encourage bus ridership including 
extended hours, new or extended bus routes to recently annexed areas, and promotional events. 

4. The City and County are encouraged to consider instituting alternative modes incentive programs for 
their employees. 

5. The Alternative Modes Coordinator shall work with community employers to assist with establishing 
alternative modes incentive programs. 

6. The City and County are encouraged to consider allowing employees to flex their work schedules to 
coincide with bus arrival and departure times. 

7. Implement strategies identified in the MET Transit study. 

8. Adjust bus schedules to serve more user groups including middle schools, high schools and MetraPark, 
and extend bus service to Lockwood, the Airport, and newly annexed areas. 
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9. Consider adjusting bus schedules to accommodate shift and commuter workers by expanding hours 
that include late night and early morning. 

10. Consider adding a bus only lane on principal arterial routes to help eliminate schedule delays due to 
traffic congestion. 

ISSUE IX: The sidewalk system in the City needs upgrading; many sidewalks are cracked and 
broken, several critical sections are missing, and important sidewalk routes are not 
adequately maintained.  

POLICY IX:  Maintain and replace sidewalks when necessary. 

1. Where appropriate, sidewalk policies should address alternatives to pedestrian facilities such as multi-
purpose improved trails, undeveloped pathways, and shared roadways. 

2. Sidewalk Construction Standards should address the need, location, timing and design of sidewalks that 
are consistent with a comprehensive sidewalk plan. 

3. Utilize the sidewalk inventory to develop a comprehensive sidewalk plan for the City and immediately 
adjacent County areas, including Lockwood. 

4. The City should periodically update its School Sidewalks Improvement Study including an inventory of 
existing condi-tions, ranking priority routes according to need, and identifying funding for replacement 
and installation. 

ISSUE X:  Lack of adequate bicycle facilities. 

POLICY X:  Develop additional bicycle facilities throughout the City and County. 

1. To expand bicycle facilities, consider the following: 
a. Develop additional signage such as “Share the Road” and “Bicycle Route”. 
b. Prohibit parking in marked bicycle lanes or incorporate both parking and bicycle lanes. 
c. Utilize Air Quality funds for the development of more bicycle facilities. 
d. Require bike rack installation as part of the commercial development standards. 
e. Provide downtown bike rentals to ease traffic circulation and to increase the availability of 

parking. 

ISSUE XI:   MET Transit is underfunded. 

POLICY XI:  Identify and develop additional revenue sources for MET Transit. 

1.  Consider incorporating public/private partnerships to finance public transportation. 
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ISSUE XII:  The deterioration of the air quality due to vehicle emissions. 

POLICY XII:  Develop incentives to promote alternative forms of transportation. 

1. Educate residents on the impact of emissions on air quality and options for alternate transportation. 

2. Explore the development of a light rail system. 

3. Explore the expansion of a southern route of Amtrak. 

4. Explore the development of a trolley/pedestrian link between Montana State University-Billings, St. 
Vincent Health Care and Billings Clinic, Dehler Park, MetraPark and the downtown. 

5. Encourage and support neighborhood schools and centrally located high-density residential 
development as a means to reduce driving to schools and school busing. 

ISSUE XIII:  Some bicyclists do not follow traffic laws and can cause unsafe situations. 

POLICY XIII:  Develop more educational opportunities and enforcement of traffic laws. 

1. Increased education of bike laws for drivers, bicyclists, and the parents of school-aged children. 

2. More police enforcement of bike laws.  

3. Explore the option of requiring the licensing of bicycles. 

ISSUE XIV:  There are more motorcycles, bicycles, and motor scooters on the roadways. 

POLICY XIV:  Develop additional education of motorcycle, bicycle, and motor scooter     awareness. 

1. Increase the publication and broadcast of Public Service Announcements on safety and awareness. 

2. Increase the education and awareness of non-motorized usage on roadways, especially at the teenage 
driver education course level. 

ISSUE XV:  Billings needs a cross-town demonstration or pilot program to illustrate that 
convenient public transportation attracts riders. 

POLICY XV: The MET should consider the development of one continuous route that extends from 
the Heights to the West End making stops at both bus transfer centers for pick-up 
and drop-off. 

1. Consider funding a pilot program to accommodate an East-West Quick Line across the City at 15-
minute intervals, from west Grand Avenue to the new transit center and the Heights Wicks route to the 
transit center. 
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  PUBLIC FACILITIES AND SERVICES ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I:    Residents are not adequately informed of County and City projects. 

POLICY I:  The public shall be informed of applications, plans and programs in a manner that 
is timely and accessible. 

1. Advertise incentive or assistance programs. 

2. The City and County shall promote accurate and timely media coverage of projects being 
considered by the City Council or County Commissioners. 

3. Seek ways to more effectively and consistently communicate information on annexations, zoning 
applications and subdivision applications via the website and other methods. 

4. Notify neighborhoods and broader areas of infrastructure projects prior to the beginning of the 
project.   

5. Key City and County contacts shall be knowledgeable of how to access information on scheduled 
public meetings and hearings. 

ISSUE II:  Dilapidated and unsafe properties in City neighborhoods and County townsites.  

POLICY II:  Commit resources to abating deteriorated and unsafe buildings, junk vehicles and 
unsightly garbage accumulation on private property. 

1. City and County Departments may assist homeowners to improve the appearance of their 
properties when it has been determined that the homeowner is financially or physically incapable 
of meeting regulations through existing programs.  Programs available, such as the Tree Removal, 
Minor Home Repair and Paint programs, should be advertised. 

2. Prior to undertaking an urban renewal project, the City shall prepare an Urban Renewal Plan in 
accordance with 7-15-4206, MCA and considering this Growth Policy and any adopted 
neighborhood or area plan that includes the area of the proposed urban renewal project. 

3. Code enforcement shall be a priority responsibility of the City and the County. 

4. The County could consider implementing an “Amnesty Program” that assists violators with 
licensing and other paper work to bring their business into compliance with State law and local 
regulations. 

5. The City may explore regulations to ensure that houses or buildings under construction are 
completed within a certain time (i.e. one year) to prevent unsafe structures and decline in 
neighborhood property values. 

6. City and County may explore regulations to ensure that houses being relocated are done so in a 
timely manner and replaced on foundations within a certain period of time (i.e. 3 months) to 
prevent unsafe structures and decline in neighborhood property values.  

 
 
 

Chapter 5.1:  Implementation Tools and Strategies 



Page 232 

ISSUE III:   Safety is a concern in neighborhoods and outlying County townsites. 

POLICY III:  Protect the lives and properties of all citizens and visitors and improve the quality 
of life in our communities. 

1. Encourage infill through incentive programs to concentrate City services. 

2. Ensure adequate resources (more people) for public safety, especially as City annexes.  

3. Utilize neighborhood task forces or councils and townsite committees to inform residents of 
Police or Sheriff activity in their communities. 

4. As funding allows, maintain acceptable levels of fire protection. 

5. As funding allows, maintain acceptable levels of police protection. 

6. Increase fire prevention education and programs creating defensible spaces around structures. 

7. Educate the public on incorporating principles of crime prevention through environmental design: 
a. Natural surveillance (the use of natural materials to facilitate open views to doors and 

windows) 
b. Natural access control (the use of natural materials to enhance or discourage access to 

buildings) 
c. Territorial reinforcement (the use of natural and architectural elements to describe boundaries 

of private property) 

8. As City annexes, maintain sufficient levels of public safety services for existing City residents. 

9. Continue to establish Neighborhood Watch programs. 

10. Continue the use of interlocal agreements with adjoining jurisdictions to share law enforcement 
services. 

11. Establish and support safe routes to school. 

ISSUE IV:  There are safety and functionality issues with City streets. 

POLICY IV:  Strive to provide safe, functional, and attractive streets for all users including 
drivers, bicyclists, and pedestrians.  Additional funding will have to be found. 

1. Entryway streets (i.e. Laurel Road, Main Street, 27th St. north of 3rd Ave.) should be made safer 
and more attractive and inviting with landscaping. 

2. Medians where no turning movements are possible should be landscaped where appropriate. 

3. Mailboxes and street light poles should be removed from highly traveled sidewalks to provide 
unhindered access for all pedestrians. 

4. Gravel left from winter road treatments should be removed from streets and sidewalks as soon as 
possible. 

5. Weeds should be sprayed along sidewalks and rights-of-way. 
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ISSUE V:   Funding for community facilities and infrastructure is very limited. 

POLICY V:  Seek new ways to ensure users are equitably paying for the services and facilities 
they demand. 

1. To fund park development and maintenance, a City-wide or County-wide park maintenance 
district could be considered. 

2. Expand the City street maintenance fee to include sidewalk maintenance for major thoroughfares. 

3. Explore the establishment of Public Safety Districts that would capture funding from all benefited 
properties, including tax exempt properties such as schools, colleges, medical facilities, etc. 

4. After the City’s Cost of Services analyses are complete, consider increasing fees where applicable 
or establishing impact fees. 

5. Support state legislation to allow a Local Option Sales tax. 

6. Reduce costs by reducing unnecessary requirements (i.e. narrower streets, use of stormwater 
swales in lieu of curb and gutter, alternative parking lot surfacing to reduce stormwater mitigation 
costs) 

7. Provide cost-saving incentives for higher density development within areas already served by City 
infrastructure and services.  

ISSUE VI:   We should review the methodology used to distribute public funds throughout City 
neighborhoods and County townsites. 

POLICY VI:  Strive to meet the needs of neighborhoods and townsites in a timely and fair 
manner. 

1. As part of neighborhood and area plans, inventory and map public improvements completed in 
neighborhoods and townsites in the past five years. 

2. The City and County should work with neighborhood and townsite residents to identify and 
prioritize public improvements through a capital improvement planning process. 

3. The City and County should involve neighborhood and townsite residents in decision of capital 
improvement expenditures through a capital improvement planning process. 

4. The City and County should coordinate with school districts and residents to reduce the likelihood 
of school closures or minimize the impacts of school closures. 

5. Improve knowledge of and access to grant funds but do not let Community Development Block 
Grant funds entirely supplant General Funds for eligible neighborhoods and townsites. 

6. Ensure that projects in the Capital Improvements Plan are consistent with this Growth Policy, 
neighborhood plans, and other approved plans. 

7. Simplify the development process and clarify ordinances. 
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ISSUE VII:  There are vacant structures around Billings and in the County that could be 
reused. 

POLICY VII: Cooperate with preservationists, developers, school districts and residents to seek 
appropriate reuse of public and private facilities. 

1. Inventory and assess the condition of existing vacant buildings. 

2. Implement more flexible or alternative building codes that encourage reuse. 

3. Distribute the inventory to organizations involved in real estate marketing, economic development 
and housing.  

4. Examine and revise zoning ordinance as necessary to allow appropriate reuse of structures. 

5. Seek funding for rehabilitation and reuse of vacant structures. 

6. Provide alternative building code solutions to firms or organizations seeking to revitalize vacant 
structures. 

7. Establish policy to allow for pre-demolition salvage of public buildings to encourage reuse of 
materials. 

8. The City should support the initiation of a glass recycling program for the community. 

ISSUE VIII:   Community services are not always available to everyone. 

POLICY VIII:  The City and County may consider community programs and services. 

1. Community Television (Channel 7) should be made more readily available to everyone, without 
subscribing to cable TV. 

2. Continue support for the creation of branch libraries in the Westend and the Heights. 

3. MET Transit bus routes should be made simpler and more accessible by offering predictable 
regular routes on major thoroughfares. 

ISSUE IX:  Subdivision review, zoning applications, and other development permit review are 
   not always conducted in a streamlined and timely manner. 

POLICY IX:  The City and County shall provide a streamlined, timely and consistent review of 
  all applications. 

1. Revision to zoning ordinances and subdivision regulations shall give consideration to this Growth 
Policy.  New ordinances and regulations shall give consideration to the preferences of the 
development community and the general public. 

2. Through the Development Process Advisory Review Board (DPARB), the City and County will 
continue an open dialogue with developers and applicants to address concerns about submittal, 
review, and approval procedures and standards. 
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ISSUE X:    Maintenance of existing K-12 school facilities and planning for new schools is 
critically important to maintaining existing communities built around the 
neighborhood school concept and fostering new communities surrounding school 
sites. 

POLICY X:  Establish a process for coordination of ongoing City/County, neighborhood, and 
school planning efforts.   

1. Establish a protocol for the sharing of objective data about future development and school 
enrollment. 

2. Formalize a system of regular meetings and communication between local government and school 
districts to discuss intersecting concerns related to funding, planning, transportation, safety, and 
development and demographic trends. 

3. Ensure that school capacity and school transportation are considered in the review process for 
residential developments. 

4. Create incentives to encourage co-location and joint use of school and community facilities to 
reduce facility costs and redundancy. 

5. Provide the school district and the public information about the direct and indirect costs and 
impacts to the community when considering school siting decisions (i.e. infrastructure 
development and improvement costs, community health costs, transportation costs, etc.) 

6. Encourage renovation of existing school facilities. 

7. Consider the schools in coordinated capital improvements planning for the community. 

8. Work in cooperation with the schools, the Chamber of Commerce and other civic organizations to 
promote an understanding of schools as important community assets. 

9. Educate local government officials on the impacts of school siting on development patterns related 
to land use, public health, transportation, and neighborhood integrity. 

ISSUE XI:   Multiple community interests (including local government, schools, arts 
organizations, and social organizations) are competing for tax dollars for facility 
development and maintenance, resulting in taxpayer fatigue and overall declining 
support for capital and maintenance projects.   

POLICY XI:  Coordinated short-term and long-range capital and maintenance planning for all 
community facilities.   

1. Develop a comprehensive community needs inventory for public facilities (schools, parks, 
libraries, etc.) along with a strategic plan for meeting those needs. The inventory process should 
include: 
a. Involvement of all stakeholders 
b. Prioritization of projects 
c. Identification of opportunities for resource sharing through joint-use of facilities 
d. Identification of opportunities for shared funding 
e. Coordination of the timing and amount of bonding requests made by involved organizations 

Chapter 5.1:  Implementation Tools and Strategies 
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  CULTURAL AND HISTORIC RESOURCES ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I: Historic landmarks and structures are being lost to neglect and development. 

POLICY I:  Enable the Yellowstone Historic Preservation Board to coordinate preservation activities 
throughout the County. 

1.  The City and County may assist the Board in implementing their annual work plans.  

2. Maintain a detailed inventory of historic properties and cultural resources, including schools. 

3. Encourage the placement of historic public buildings on The National Register. 

4. Create a local registry that allows historic buildings to be locally recognized and protected.  

5. Encourage the preservation and continued use of historic schools. 

ISSUE II: Cities must link economic development with quality of life.  Businesses and professionals 
are attracted to a culturally aware city. 

POLICY II:  The community should recognize and use its cultural institutions as assets and 
opportunities for attracting and generating additional economic activity.     

1. Promote the rich cultural life of the region wherever possible in publications, advertising, and other 
promotion efforts. 

2. Stress the quality of the community’s cultural institutions as they relate to other cities, especially in region
-wide publications. 

3. Encourage the community’s colleges, hospitals, and businesses to feature the cultural institutions in their 
recruiting efforts.  The Chamber of Commerce is an excellent example of one source for this information. 

4. Maintain the beauty of our park system and the cultural institutions that the community currently has, i.e. 
a large regional art museum, three history museums, a major performing arts theater, a large performing 
venue, two community theaters, a symphony orchestra, an opera company, a city/county library, two 
college libraries, historic sites, and a zoo. 

ISSUE III: Public art is seen as an important part of the landscape. 

POLICY III: Carefully selected works of public art should be put on display to enhance the beauty 
and visual excitement of the city. 

1. Encourage promotional events that incorporate public art throughout the City. 

2. Inventory private and public properties where public art can be viewed and donate space to local organ
-izations and artists for approved public art displays. 

3. Create public spaces for public gatherings, i.e. outdoor walking plazas, that would also allow for public 
art display, art shows, craft fairs, outdoor markets etc. 

4. Consider contacting other cities such as Boise, Idaho for the plans and procedures they have used for 
creating a very successful public art program. 
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5. Explore and consider the Percent for Art 5 strategies that have been used in other states and cities.  

ISSUE IV: There is no requirement for surface archeological surveys to be conducted prior to many 
development processes, nor is there a provision for salvaging any sites that are 
discovered. 

POLICY IV: Develop a process for protecting archeological, historical, and paleontological resources 
during earth-disturbing construction activities. 

1. Work with the State Historic Preservation Office (SHPO) to identify and map areas in the rapidly 
developing areas of the County and around Billings where archeological surveys have already been 
conducted or where there is a high probability such of sites.  Make these data available to developers and 
contractors. 

2. Consider appropriate surveys be done as a condition of subdivision or construction permits. 

3. Work with SHPO and local museums to provide curation of resulting cultural or historical artifacts. 

Chapter 5.1:  Implementation Tools and Strategies 

5 “Percent for Art” programs have been established in 27 states to facilitate the placement of permanent art of the highest possible quality 
where it is accessible to the general public during new public construction projects.  For example, Oregon Revised Statutes requires "not less 
than 1% of the direct construction funds of new or remodeled state buildings with construction budgets of $100,000 or greater for the acqui-
sition of art work which may be an integral part of the building, attached thereto, or capable of display in other State Buildings". http://
www.oregonartscommission.org/public_art/percent_for_public_art_program.php  
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IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGIES:  COMMUNITY HEALTH ELEMENT 
 
ISSUE I:  Existing neighborhood plans lack sufficient detail to address emergency 

preparedness. 

POLICY I: Create neighborhood plans that encourage emergency preparedness. 

1. Involve the fire department and other local emergency responders to educate citizens on 
emergency preparedness and prevention. 

2. Support neighborhood development that provides more than one entrance and/or exit for residents. 

3. Ensure neighborhoods with cul-de-sacs and dead-end streets have adequate access for emergency 
service providers. 

4. Plan neighborhoods that foster disaster and evacuation routes. 

5. Identify floodplain areas that may be utilized for open space and park corridors to provide natural 
buffer areas from waterways, protect lives and property, and prevent land use conflicts when 
development occurs. 

6. Encourage subdivision design, building placement, and landscaping that minimizes wildfire risk. 

7. Identify and map areas of wildfire risk. 

8. Create ways to mitigate problems that could potentially pose vector-borne and rodent-associated 
health threats, e.g., West Nile Virus and Hantavirus. 
a. Eradicate standing water to limit the number of place for mosquitoes to reproduce. 
b. Encourage removal of dilapidated and unsafe properties in City neighborhoods and County 

townsites. 
c. Educate residents on the advantages and disadvantages of special purpose districts such as 

weed and mosquito control districts.  
 
ISSUE II:  Not all neighborhoods are planned with ways to access nutritious foods. 

POLICY II: Strive to increase access to nutritious foods for residents in all neighborhoods. 

1. Encourage the presence of grocers within mixed-use neighborhoods. 

2. Improve ways to access existing grocers. 
a. Offer viable alternative transportation methods such as MET Transit. 
b. Consider altering MET Transit routes. 

3. Support table/community gardens. 

4. Promote the operation and expansion of local farmers’ markets. 

5. Promote healthy eating in schools. 

6. Consider providing incentives to providers for grocery delivery services. 
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ISSUE III:  Some roadways are not designed to accommodate pedestrians and therefore create 
inconvenient and unsafe conditions.  

POLICY III: Design roadways to safely accommodate pedestrians and promote physical 
activity.  

1. Install traffic calming devices in residential neighborhoods to discourage cut-through traffic and 
ensure pedestrian safety. 

2. Maintain routine upkeep of pedestrian walkways, e.g., removal of gravel on sidewalks, etc. 

3. Provide wide shoulders on roadways where sidewalks do not exist. 

4. Encourage subdivisions to incorporate safe routes to school during the planning process; create 
opportunities for existing communities to identify safe routes to school. 

5. Require subdivisions to provide for the continuation of pedestrian and bicycle access as identified 
by Heritage Trails Plan 

6. Educate all commuters: automobile, bicycle, etc. on bicycle right-of-way, traffic laws, and round-
about navigation. 

ISSUE IV:  Physical activity is not seen as a viable means of getting from place to place.  

POLICY IV: Promote physical activity as part of everyday living.  

1. Create mixed use developments that offer convenient places to work and shop within walking 
distance of residences. 

2. Encourage physical activity for school-aged children by providing safe routes to school and 
maintaining the neighborhood school concept. 

3. Develop trails that can be utilized for transportation to destinations, e.g., downtown. 

4. Identify and map new and existing trails—see Heritage Trail map. 

5. Continue to promote the “Buses and Bikes” program. 

ISSUE V:  Neighborhoods lack a sense of community, which is contributing to neighborhood 
decline. 

POLICY V: Provide neighborhoods with the tools necessary to become successful communities. 

1. Encourage community gathering places. 

2. Prioritize construction of Aquatic Center/Community center in Heights. 

3. Promote the organization of community gardens. 

4. Encourage neighborhoods to give back to the community through activities such as annual 
cleanup day. 

5. Amend Public Nuisance Ordinance to address the removal of boarded up and abandoned houses in 
neighborhoods. 

6. Support neighborhood schools as centers of community. 

Chapter 5.1:  Implementation Tools and Strategies 



Page 240 

ISSUE VI:  Some neighborhoods are not safe.  

POLICY VI: Protect the lives and properties of all citizens and visitors to improve the quality of 
life in our communities.  

1. Encourage kids to play in parks to keep them off the streets. 

2. Encourage neighborhoods to provide adequate street lighting. 

3. Encourage Neighborhood Watch programs and resources for public safety and crime prevention. 

4. Provide adequate traffic control. 

5. Provide a safe and secure environment in neighborhood parks by preventing illegal activities and 
use by transient and homeless populations as camping areas. 

ISSUE VII: Poor housing and lack of living wage jobs puts the health of residents at risk. 

POLICY VII: Increase the amount of affordable housing and availability of jobs that pay a 
living wage.  

1. Enable the development of affordable housing, particularly near work centers and existing 
neighborhood schools, by providing development incentives. 

2. Make recommendations for land use that may include rehabilitation and redevelopment. 

3. Attract businesses with a minimum average annual wage equal to the living wage index. 

4. Continue to improve marketing of our community to employers pay a living wage. 

Chapter 5.1:  Implementation Tools and Strategies 
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Chapter 5.2:  Capital Improvement Strategy 

5.2 CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT 
STRATEGY 
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
Capital improvements are considered 
development, maintenance or replacement 
projects that are in excess of $25,000.  They 
include, but are not limited to water and sewer 
systems, wastewater treatment facilities, park 
improvements, solid waste facilities, fire 
protection facilities, roads and bridges.  The City 
of Billings and Yellowstone County differ in 
their strategies to plan for capital improvements.  
The City’s capital improvement strategy focuses 
on a public involvement process to identify and 
prioritize projects.  The result of this process is 
an annually updated Capital Improvements Plan.  
The County’s strategy is less formal and relies 
on internal input from departments to identify 
capital projects that may be funded for the 
current year.  There are other entities within the 
County that are responsible for public capital 
improvements and each have its own funding 
sources and capital improvement planning 
process. 
 
CITY OF BILLINGS 
 
The City adopted its current approach to capital 
improvements planning in 2001.  The approach 
relies on public input to identify capital projects, 
internal review and analysis, and City Council 
approval.  The procedure generally begins in the 
beginning of the current fiscal year (fiscal years 
run from July 1st through June 30th) and the 
Capital Improvements Plan (CIP) is finalized at 
the end of the budgeting process for the 
following year.  The full public participation 
process for the CIP is run every other year, with 
off-years being reserved for minor internal 
modifications.  For example, the full public 
hearing process for the FY08-12 CIP began in 
late 2006 and was adopted by City Council in 
February of 2007.  .  A year later, in the fall of 
2007, City Department heads made minor 
amendments and adjustments to the FY08-12 
CIP, which were then adopted in February of 
2008 by City Council as the FY 09-13 CIP. 
In addition to public input on capital project 
preferences, each City Department must submit 

a list and identify funding sources available for 
capital projects.  The CIP is to be fiscally 
constrained to present a realistic depiction of 
which projects may be accomplished within the 
5-year planning period. 
 
In conjunction with the CIP process, the City 
also programs funds for technical equipment and 
vehicle equipment replacement.  The Technical 
Replacement Plan (TRP) identifies the 
replacement schedule and costs for staff 
computers and other electronic equipment.  The 
Equipment Replacement  Plan (ERP), identifies 
replacement and funding guidelines for vehicles 
and equipment with a value of more than $5,000 
and a useful life of 3 years or longer.  These two 
plans are incorporated into the CIP as separate 
subsets. 
 
A current version of the CIP can be found within 
the City Budget on the City of Billings’ Finance 
Department website. 
 
YELLOWSTONE COUNTY 
 
The County Commissioners evaluate and 
prioritize capital improvement requests received 
from County departments during their budgeting 
process.  Other than the road and bridge projects, 
capital improvements are funded through the 
Capital Projects Fund.  Funds are usually 
accumulated to provide funding for replacement 
or major maintenance of buildings or equipment.  
The County Public Works Department is 
responsible for scheduling major road and bridge 
projects.  Other public entities throughout the 
County are responsible for community sewer, 
water, fire and school capital improvements. 
 
The County has one water district (County 
Water District of Billings Heights), one sewer 
district (Custer), and two combined sewer and 
water districts (Lockwood, and Worden-
Ballantine).  Districts are administered by boards 
and have the authority to assess users for needed 
construction, repairs and maintenance.  Other 
districts with taxing authority include schools, 
fire districts, and the Lockwood Transportation 
District.  These entities prepare capital 
improvement plans for their facilities and 
equipment. 
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5.3 EVALUATION TIMELINE 
 

YEARLY ACTIVITY REVIEW  
 
One of the key elements to the Growth Policy is 
implementing the recommendations to meet the 
goals and objectives.  Since the document is 
required to be updated every five years, having a 
guideline for implementation over that period is 
essential.  Some of the goals and objectives will 
be addressed as part of the ongoing Work 
Program of the Planning and Community 
Services Department.  For example, the Land 
Use Element goal of affordable housing is 
within the strategic plan of the Community 
Services Division, and the transportation goals 
will be included in the 2008 update of the 
Transportation Plan.  Some of the goals and 
objectives will be addressed with existing 
resources.  For example, the position of an 
Alternative Modes Coordinator is focused on the 
trail goals in the Open Space and Recreation 
Element and the City and County Public Works 
Departments are developing a plan to decrease 
contamination in stormwater runoff that 
addresses the clean water goal in the Natural 
Resources Element. 
 
It is anticipated that the yearly work programs 
and resources of all City and County 
departments will reflect activities directed 
toward implementing the Growth Policy.  Each 
year during the budget cycle, the Planning and 
Community Services Department will review 
those work programs for implementation 
strategies and make a report to the governing 
bodies. 
 
FIVE YEAR REVIEW AND TIMELINE 
 
As noted, communities are required to review 
their Growth Policies every five years.  The 
purpose of the review is to determine what 
changes need to be made to the document to 
keep it current, and to make sure it continues to 
reflect community goals and objectives.  
However, the Growth Policy can be amended at 
any time in the five-year period if major changes 

take place in the community such as a citizen-
initiated amendment, a significant budgetary 
change, or a considerable change in policies of 
the governing body. 
 
Any revision to the Growth Policy must be 
directed by criteria for review.  Whether this 
occurs at the formal review every five years, or 
within the five year time frame, the review 
criteria must be consistently applied.  The 
following criteria for review will be used to 
warrant and guide revisions: 
 
• Major changes in existing conditions or 

projected trends 
• Basic alterations of best practice standards 
• Modifications in the legal requirements a 

Growth Policy must meet 
• Successful completion of a strategy meeting 

goals and objectives 
• Citizens desire for changes to the Growth 

Policy 
• Changes in community direction and goals 
• Adoption of a plan inconsistent with the 

Growth Policy 
 
PROCESS 
 
Based on the review criteria, if the City and 
County conclude a Growth Policy revision is 
warranted, the staff will conduct research and 
prepare draft revisions.   An assessment of the 
proposed revisions should be prepared including 
the impacts of the revisions, a timeline for 
implementation of any new goals and objectives 
and a list of strategies for implementation. 
 
In order for revisions to be consistent with state 
statute, a public hearing before the Planning 
Board is required.  The degree of public 
involvement will depend on the scope of the 
proposed revisions.  After the public hearing, the 
Planning Board will make recommendations to 
the governing bodies regarding the revisions.  
The governing bodies will then act to adopt 
revisions or amendments. 
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5.4 INTER-JURISDICTIONAL 
COORDINATION AND COOPERATION 

 
INTRODUCTION  
 
State law requires that this Growth Policy 
include a statement on how the governing bodies 
will coordinate and cooperate with other 
jurisdictions in matters related to the growth 
policy.  Coordination of planning matters 
between Yellowstone County and the City of 
Billings is facilitated primarily through the 
Yellowstone County Planning Board.  The 
jurisdiction of this board is the entire County, 
including the City of Billings and Town of 
Broadview but not including the City of Laurel 
planning jurisdiction.  This countywide 
jurisdiction enables the Planning Board to 
coordinate policies with the County 
Commissioners and the City Council.  
 
COORDINATED PLANNING IN YELLOWSTONE 
COUNTY 
 
The history of coordinated planning in 
Yellowstone County goes back approximately 
sixty years.  Based on records kept in the 
Planning Department, there has been some form 
of a joint planning board since the early 1940s.  
The most recent Planning Board structure was 
authorized through an interlocal agreement 
adopted in 1984 and amended in 1990 and again 
in 1995.  The interlocal agreement establishes 
the administrative and financing responsibilities 
of each jurisdiction, the relationship of the 
Planning Board to the governing bodies and the 
relationship of the Planning Board and Planning 
Department Director and staff.   
 
There are fifteen members on the County 
Planning Board; seven are appointed by the 
County Commissioners, five are appointed by 
the Mayor of Billings, one member is appointed 
by the County Commissioners from the 
governing board of the Yellowstone County 
Conservation District, and two members are ex-
officio non-voting representative of School 
District No. 2 and the County Superintendent of 

Schools.  Board members serve 2-year terms.  
The duties and responsibilities of the Planning 
Board are described in the By-Laws, last 
amended in 2002.  In addition to other duties, 
the Board is responsible for developing a 
Growth Policy for the Board’s jurisdiction. 
 
In 1991, the City of Billings, Town of 
Broadview, and Yellowstone County adopted 
the first countywide comprehensive plan: The 
1990 Yellowstone County Comprehensive Plan.  
Until then, the City and County developed 
separate planning documents.  The 
Comprehensive Plan established goals and 
objectives and addressed separate City and 
County issues, as well as joint issues that 
involved both the City and County.  In 2003, the 
Comprehensive Plan was updated, and renamed 
the 2003 Yellowstone County and City of 
Billings Growth Policy. 
 
The Yellowstone County Planning Board, as the 
designated Metropolitan Planning Organization 
(MPO), is also charged with the responsibility 
for transportation planning for the Billings 
Urban Area.  To accomplish this, the Board 
prepares a Unified Planning Work Program 
(UPWP) each year that contains a description of 
projects to undertake during the upcoming 
program year.  It also contains appropriate 
funding information, staffing information, and a 
schedule for each project.  The UPWP is 
supplemented by a 5-year Transportation 
Improvements Plan (TIP).  The TIP is a fiscal 
planning program for federally assisted highway 
and transit improvements for the Billings urban 
area.  Approximately every ten years, the MPO 
is responsible for drafting a Transportation Plan 
that assesses the transportation needs of the 
Billings Urban Area and recommends actions to 
address those needs.  The most recent 
Transportation Plan was adopted in 2005. 
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The City and County conduct transportation 
planning together for the Billings urban area.  
Two committees, the Policy Coordinating 
Committee (PCC) and Technical Advisory 
Committee (TAC), were created through a 
Memorandum of Agreement signed by the City, 
County, County Planning Board, and the 
Montana Department of Transportation.  The 
PCC is responsible for directing transportation 
policy for the study area and the TAC provides 
technical advice to the PCC. 
 
In addition to the 1990 Comprehensive Plan, the 
2003 Growth Policy and the 2005 Transportation 
Plan, there have been a number of other plans 
adopted by both the City and County to address 
common issues.  These plans include the South 
Billings Boulevard Master Plan and entryway 
zoning regulations (1993), Yellowstone River 
Greenway Master Plan (1994), 1995 BikeNet 
Plan (1995), and the West Billings Master Plan 
(2001), 2004 Heritage Trail Plan, and a number 
of neighborhood and community plans.  With 
the exception of the 1990 Yellowstone County 
Comprehensive Plan, and the 2003 Growth 
Policy, this growth policy does not supersede 
existing plans or their updates, unless otherwise 
stated.  The 2008 Yellowstone County – City of 
Billings Growth Policy refers to and is 
consistent with the plans listed above. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

ONGOING CITY AND COUNTY PLANNING 
COORDINATION 
 
There are a number of other coordinated efforts 
to address common issues, primarily for the 
Billings urban area.  As a joint City-County 
office, the Planning and Community Services 
Department administers all planning programs 
for both jurisdictions.  Additional city-county 
coordination on planning issues includes the 
following: 
 
• Subdivision proposals adjacent to the City 

limits are reviewed by both City and County 
agencies.  Subdivision proposals are also 
reviewed by state agencies when applicable 
for such issues as impacts on wildlife and 
wildlife habitat, wildfire hazards, 
transportation, as well as other issues. 

 
• The City and County have a joint Health 

Department that is responsible for public 
and environmental health programs in both 
jurisdictions.  RiverStone Health’s water 
quality and sanitation programs have strong 
links to land use and transportation planning 
in Yellowstone County. 

 
• The City of Billings, City of Laurel, 

Yellowstone County, and the Crow Indian 
Tribe entered into an interlocal agreement 
for historic preservation.  This agreement 
created the Yellowstone Historic 
Preservation Board and Certified Local 
Government.  This board reviews and 
implements various policies for historic, 
archeological, and cultural preservation 
issues throughout Yellowstone County.  
Each governmental  agency has 
representation on this board. 

 
• The Yellowstone County Air Quality Board 

serves both the City and County through a 
Memorandum of Agreement to address local 
air quality issues. 

 
• The City Fire Department has a contractual 

agreement with the Billing Urban Fire 
Service Area (BUFSA) to provide fire 
suppression and first response services. The 



Page 245 

Chapter 5.4:  Inter-Jurisdictional Coordination and Cooperation 

Department also contracts equipment and 
labor to the Montana Department of Natural 
Resources for wildfire suppression in times 
of need.  The Department also has mutual 
aid agreements with CHS Refinery, 
ConocoPhillips Refinery, ExxonMobil 
Refinery, Lockwood Fire Department, 
Billings Logan International Airport Aircraft 
Rescue Firefighting, and the Laurel 
Volunteer Fire Department. 

 
• Subdiv i s ion ,  zon ing ,  f loodp la in 

administration, permitting, and enforcement 
programs rely on strong collaborative efforts 
with other departments in the city and 
county, as well as with state and federal 
agencies. 

 
• The City, County and State share 

Geographic Information System Resources 
pursuant to a Memorandum of 
Understanding.  Based on this agreement, 
the Montana Department of Revenue shares 
property ownership and tax information with 
the Yellowstone County Information 
Systems Department.  In return, the County 
maintains the City and County parcel 
coverage with the assistance of the City of 
Billings. 

 
STRATEGY FOR FUTURE COOPERATION 
 
The City and the County will continue to 
improve their cooperative relationships by 
maintaining a joint City-County Planning Board 
and continuing the existing cooperative 
agreements.  The Planning Board and existing 
coordinating organizations will strive to 
implement this Growth Policy equitably, openly, 
and for the benefit of all residents. 
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5.5  SUBDIVISION REVIEW 
 
POLICY AND SUBDIVISION REVIEW 
 
Every county, city and town is required to adopt 
and enforce subdivision regulations that provide 
for the orderly development of their 
jurisdictional areas.  The Montana Subdivision 
and Platting Act (Title 76, Chapter 3, MCA) 
specifies the purpose and minimum 
requirements of the subdivision regulations.  It is 
incumbent on the local governing body to adopt 
regulations consistent with this law and to 
review subdivision applications in accordance 
with the criteria provided in 76-3-608(3)(a): 
 
1. The effect on agriculture 
2. The effect on agricultural water user’s 

facilities 
3. The effect on local services 
4. The effect on the natural environment 
5. The effect on wildlife and wildlife habitat 
6. The effect on public health and safety 
   
This chapter presents both definitions of the 
review criteria and describes how these criteria 
are to be used to review subdivisions. 
 
PRIMARY REVIEW CRITERIA 
 
A growth policy is required to include a 
statement explaining how the governing bodies 
will define agriculture, agricultural water user 
facilities, local services, the natural environment, 
wildlife and wildlife habitat, and public health 
and safety and describe how these items will be 
used in the evaluation and decisions of a 
subdivision proposal (76-1-601(3)(h), MCA).  
The following section provides detailed 
definitions of the primary review criteria and 
how the criteria will be applied in subdivision 
review.   
 
Each subdivision proposal shall be evaluated 
based on its effect on certain factors expressed in 
this Growth Policy and implemented through the 
City and County Subdivision Regulations.     

The evaluation factors specify what effects 
should be considered at the time of subdivision 
review.  The degree to which these effects play a 
role in subdivision approval and denial will be 
dependent on 1) whether the effects are allowed 
by existing laws and regulations, and 2) whether 
the effects can be reasonably mitigated. 
 
Agriculture 
 
Definition 
Agriculture means the use of land for growing, 
raising, or marketing of plants or animals to 
produce food, feed, and fiber commodities.  
Examples of agricultural activities include, but 
are not limited to, cultivation and tillage of the 
soil; dairying; growing and harvesting of 
agricultural or horticultural commodities; and 
the raising of livestock, bees, fur-bearing 
animals, or poultry.  Agriculture does not 
include gardening for personal use, keeping of 
house pets, kenneling, or landscaping for 
aesthetic purposes.  The definition of 
agricultural land also includes land considered 
by the Natural Resources Conservation Service 
to have a soil of agricultural importance and 
lands devoted to a soil conservation or rangeland 
management program. 
 
Evaluation Factors 
1. The amount of agricultural land removed 

from production shall be considered. 
2. The amount of agricultural land with soil 

considered prime or having statewide or 
local importance by the Natural Resources 
and Conservation Service shall be 
considered. 

3. Subdivision review shall consider the 
potential conflicts between the proposed 
subdivision and adjacent agricultural 
operations, including: 
a. Interference with the movement of 

livestock or farm machinery 
b. Maintenance of fences 
c. Proliferation of weeds 
d. Harassment of livestock by pets 
e. Odors 
f. Visual quality 
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4. It shall be determined whether the proposal 
is located within the Urban Planning Area or 
in the “Limits of Annexation” as defined by 
the City’s Annexation Policy. 

  
Agricultural Water User Facilities 
 
Definition 
Agricultural water user facilities shall mean 
those facilities which provide water for 
agricultural land or provide water for the 
production of agricultural products.  These 
facilities include, but are not limited to ditches, 
canals, pipes, head gates, tanks, drains, 
reservoirs, ponds and developed springs used for 
agricultural purposes. 
 
Evaluation Factors 
1. The location and proximity of an 

agricultural water user facility shall be 
considered. 

2. Potential conflicts between facility users and 
subdivision residents shall be evaluated. 

3. The rights of all water right owners and 
users of the facility shall be considered. 

 
Local Services 
 
Definition 
Local services means any and all services 
provided to the public by local government 
entities or public utilities such as transportation 
systems, including non-motorized facilities, 
parking, law enforcement, fire protection, 
drainage structures, water supply, sanitary 
sewage disposal, solid waste disposal, 
recreation, parks, libraries, or schools. 
 
Evaluation Factors 
1. Subdivision review shall consider the goals 

and objectives of existing plans. 
2. Subdivision review shall consider increased 

demand on services and need to expand 
services as a result of the proposal.  Lack of 
adequate service capacity and capability of a 
local service may be grounds for denial if 
the situation cannot be mitigated by the 
applicant. 

3. The cost of providing services shall be 
evaluated by determining the per capita or 
per lot cost of services and current and 
anticipated tax and fee revenue.   

 
Natural Environment 
 
Definition 
The natural environment means the physical, 
chemical, and biological factors that exist within 
or influence a geographic area or community.  
These factors include, but are not limited to, 
geology, soils, topography, climate, surface 
water, groundwater, floodplain, vegetation, and 
objects or places of cultural, historic, or aesthetic 
significance. 
 
Evaluation Factors 
1. Review of the subdivision shall consider the 

degree of impact to the following 
environmental features: 
a. Riparian or wetland areas 
b. Vegetation cover or type 
c. Noxious weeds 
d. Important or sensitive natural habitats 
e. Surface and groundwater quality 
f. Stream bank stability 
g. Erodible soils 
h. Cultural and historic landmarks  

2. The amount of appropriate open space 
preserved for natural resource conservation 
shall be considered. 

3. Results of water and sanitary facility 
inspection for all lots shall be considered. 

4. Subdivision review shall also evaluate the 
amount of cuts and fill on slopes as a result 
of road or building construction. 

 
Wildlife and Wildlife Habitat 
 
Definition 
Wildlife means animals that are not 
domesticated or tamed. Wildlife habitat means 
an area containing the complex of environmental 
conditions essential to wildlife for feeding and 
forage, cover, migration, breeding, rearing, 
nesting, or buffers from those areas.  It also 
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includes areas essential to the conservation of 
species protected by the Endangered Species Act 
or of special interest or concern to the State of 
Montana. 
 
Evaluation Factors 
1. The presence and potential destruction of 

wildlife and wildlife habitat shall be 
considered in subdivision review. 

2. Subdivision review shall consider the 
potential for human-wildlife conflicts or 
unhealthy encounters. 

3. The amount of wildlife-friendly amenities, 
such as preserved open space, enhanced 
habitat or wildlife protection devices shall 
be considered in subdivision review. 

 
Public Health and Safety 
 
Definition 
Allowable standards established by Federal, 
State and local policies, codes, and regulations 
shall be the primary means for defining the 
limits of acceptable public health and safety.  
Any variance from these standards shall be 
reasonably mitigated and approved by the 
governing body.   
 
Evaluation Factors 
1. The subdivision review shall consider all 

potential hazards to residents of the 
subdivision from high voltage lines, high-
pressure gas lines, highways, railroads or 
railroad crossing and nearby industrial or 
mining activity. 

2. Any creation of public health or safety 
hazards by the subdivision, such as traffic or 
fire conditions, contamination or depletion 
of groundwater supplies, accelerated 
stormwater runoff, widening or existing 
floodplain or flood hazard area, or existence 
within the Wildland-Urban Interface, must 
be considered in subdivision review.   
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PUBLIC HEARING PROCESS 
 
As part of the major subdivision preliminary plat review process, a public hearing is required.  The 
requirement for a public hearing is not applicable to the first minor subdivision of a tract of record.  
State law requires the governing body or its authorized agent to conduct the public hearing.  Both the 
Board of County Commissioners and the City Council have relinquished that task to the County 
Planning Board.   An outline of the public hearing process adopted by the Planning Board can be found 
in the By-Laws of Yellowstone County Board of Planning, as amended.  The following hearing process 
is reproduced in its entirety from Section 5 of the By-Laws. 
 

SECTION 5 PUBLIC HEARINGS 
The Board shall cause to be published a Notice of Public Hearing containing the date, 
time, location and purpose pursuant to statutory requirements in a newspaper of general 
circulation for each hearing held by the Board. 

A. Public Hearing for Subdivisions 
(1) When a preliminary plat application is set for a public hearing 

pursuant to a public notice, the matter shall be heard even 
though no one in favor or in opposition to the application 
appears at the hearing, unless the Board has received a written 
request from the subdivider, twenty-four (24) hours prior to the 
public hearing, to continue such hearing at a later time due to 
good and sufficient reason, or to withdraw or postpone the 
application for reasons approved by the Board. 

(2) Each person who speaks at the public hearing shall stand and 
furnish his/her name and address to the Board and shall thereby 
become a part of the record. 

(3) Each preliminary plat application shall be heard in the 
following order: 

(a) A Planning Department staff member shall summarize 
pertinent data and present or amplify the 
recommendations of staff and department heads. 

(b) The applicant, or his/her representative shall present the 
application to the Board and summarize the proposed 
subdivision and, if applicable, provide information on the 
following criteria of public interest: 

1. Effects on Agriculture 
2. Effects on Local Services 
3. Effects on Natural Environment 
4. Effects on Wildlife and Wildlife Habitat 
5. Effects on Public Health and Safety 

In addition, the Board shall determine compliance with 
local regulations and the Transportation Plan and 
Yellowstone County Comprehensive Plan. 

(c) Persons in favor or opposed to the application shall be 
heard or written comments received up and until the time 
of the close of the public hearing. 

B. Other Public Hearings 
(1) All other public hearings shall be conducted in accordance with 
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the following procedure unless the Board determines by 
majority vote to follow some different procedure: 

(a) The Board shall first hear a report on the subject item 
from the Planning Department staff, which report may 
include a recommendation as to the action to be taken by 
the Board. 

(b) The Board shall then hear and/or receive written or oral 
statements from the public, in the following order: 

1. Proponents of the proposal. 
2. Opponents of the proposal. 
3. Members of the public who, being neither 

proponents nor opponents of the proposal, wish to 
make a general statement or comment regarding the 
same. 

4. The Board shall then hear any brief rebuttal to 
previous comments, testimony or statements. 

5. The Board shall then hear brief final comments, 
statements or recommendations, if any, from the 
Planning Department staff. 

6. Any person wishing to speak a second time may do 
so only during the proper course of the 
proceedings, only after all persons wishing to speak 
have been heard and only with the permission of 
the President or the approval of the majority of the 
Board members. 

(2) Prior to hearing and/or oral statements, comments, or testimony 
from the public, the Board may, by majority vote, impose 
reasonable and prudent limitations of the time allotted for each 
person’s oral statement, comment, or testimony. 

(3) The Board or any member thereof, may at any time question 
any person about his/her statements, comments, or testimony. 

(4) After hearing any and all statements, comments and testimony 
as above-provided, the President shall close the public 
testimony portion of the hearing.  After closure, and after such 
discussion as may be appropriate, the Board may vote upon a 
recommendation for the item under consideration. 

(5) Subject to any time constraints imposed by law, the Board may, 
at any stage of a public hearing or proceeding, continue the 
same to a later date in order to allow or facilitate full public 
participation, to obtain additional information, to properly 
consider or deliberate any matter, or for any other lawful 
reason.  The case of such continuance, the time and place of all 
further proceedings in regard thereto shall be immediately fixed 
and announced to the Planning Department staff and the public, 
in which case no further legal notice of hearing need be given. 

C. Informal Hearings 
The Board may, by majority vote, follow some other procedures for the conduct of 
hearings. 
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